
Delta Fuel Co. LLC Cherokee Services LLC Breaux Petroleum                              Safety-Kleen Systems, Inc Miguez Fuel, LLC CG Elite LLC Gaubert Oil

Bid Item:

Effective Period:
 Dept Personnel: 10% Bid Preference 10% Bid Preference 10% Bid Preference 10% Bid Preference 10% Bid Preference

Item# Engine Oils UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 (A) Super All Season Group II Engine Oil, 5W30 Quart  12qt/cs  3.35 No bid 32.04 3.07 2.99 3.17  12qt/cs  3.49
2 (A) Super All Season Group II Engine Oil, 5W30 5 gallon N/A No bid No bid No bid 45.00 No bid No bid
3 (A) Super All Season Group II Engine Oil, 5W30 55 gallon 737.85 No bid 617.65 520.00 479.00 445.78 572.55
4 (A) Super All Season Group II Engine Oil, 5W30 Bulk per gallon 12.85 No bid No bid 8.50 6.99 8.06 9.21

Oil Brand: Chevron Shell Performance Plus Omni/Pureguard Com 2 Chevron

Oil Type: CHV Supreme SynBlend Pennzoil SAE 5W30 SynBlend 5W30 SW30 SynBlend Supreme SynBlend 5W30

5 (B) Super All Season Group II Engine Oil, 10W30 Quart  12qt/cs  3.35 No bid No bid No bid 2.99 3.17 No bid
6 (B) Super All Season Group II Engine Oil, 10W30 5 gallon N/A No bid No bid No bid 45.00 No bid No bid
7 (B) Super All Season Group II Engine Oil, 10W30 55 gallon 737.85 No bid No bid 520.00 479.00 445.78 985.05
8 (B) Super All Season Group II Engine Oil, 10W30 Bulk per gallon 12.85 No bid No bid 8.50 6.99 8.06 No bid

Oil Brand: Chevron Performance Plus Omni/Pureguard Com 2 Havoline HM

Oil Type: CHV Supreme SynBlend SynBlend 10W30 10W30 Syn Blend Havoline HM Syntech 10W30

9 (C) Fleet Supreme EC Engine Oil, 15W40 Quart N/A No bid No bid No bid 2.89 4.45 No bid
10 (C) Fleet Supreme EC Engine Oil, 15W40 5 gallon 68.95 No bid No bid 56.50 53.00 64.86 64.10
11 (C) Fleet Supreme EC Engine Oil, 15W40 55 gallon 703.45 684.00 No bid 600.00 553.00 556.30 673.20
12 (C) Fleet Supreme EC Engine Oil, 15W40 Bulk per gallon No Bid 10.94 No bid 9.95 8.50 9.66 10.99

Oil Brand: Chevron Shell Performance Plus Omni/Pureguard Com 2 Chevron URSA
Oil Type: CHV URSA SUPER+ T2 HD15W40 SynBlend 15W40 15W40 CK-4 SP  15W40

13 (D) Guardol ECT Diesel Engine Oil, 15W40 Quart 5.83 No bid No bid No bid 2.89 4.45  12qt/cs  4.62
14 (D) Guardol ECT Diesel Engine Oil, 15W40 5 gallon 77.30 No bid No bid 56.50 53.00 64.86 66.97
15 (D) Guardol ECT Diesel Engine Oil, 15W40 55 gallon 795.30 No bid No bid 600.00 553.00 556.30 827.20
16 (D) Guardol ECT Diesel Engine Oil, 15W40 Bulk per gallon 13.46 No bid No bid 9.95 8.50 9.66 13.70

Oil Brand: Chevron Performance Plus Omni/Pureguard Com 2 Chevron Delo 400
Oil Type: CHV DELO 400 XLE SB SynBlend 15W40 15W40 CK-4 XLE SB 15W40

17 (E)  Shield Choice Engine Oil 5W20 Quart  12qt/cs  3.35 No bid 32.04 No bid 2.99 3.17  12qt/cs  3.83
18 (E)  Shield Choice Engine Oil 5W20 5 gallon N/A No bid No bid No bid 45.00 No bid No bid
19 (E)  Shield Choice Engine Oil 5W20 55 gallon 737.85 No bid 617.65 520.00 479.00 445.78 669.11
20 (E)  Shield Choice Engine Oil 5W20 Bulk per gallon 12.85 No bid No bid 8.50 6.99 8.06 12.01

Oil Brand: Chevron Shell Performance Plus Omni/Pureguard Com 2 Chevron
Oil Type: CHV Supreme SynBlend Pennzoil SAE 5W20 SynBlend 5W20 5W20 SynBlend Havoline SynBlend 5W20

21 (F) Mobil 1 FS Oil 0W40 Quart N/A No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
22 (F) Mobil 1 FS Oil 0W40  5 gallon N/A No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

Oil Brand:
Oil Type:

23 (G) Versa Trans ATF Quart 4.89 No bid No bid 4.19 4.50 No bid No bid
24 (G) Versa Trans ATF 5 gallon N/A No bid No bid 74.50 94.00 No bid No bid

Oil Brand: Chevron Performance Plus Kenball
Oil Type: HAV Global MV ATF Versatrans LV

25 (H) Dexron-VI Automatic Transmission Oil Quart 5.80 No bid 37.02 4.19 4.50 5.49  12qt/cs  5.49
26 (H) Dexron-VI Automatic Transmission Oil Bulk per gallon N/A No bid No bid 13.75 15.99 16.93 No bid

Oil Brand: Chevron Shell Performance Plus Kenball Com 2 Chevron/Havoline 
Oil Type: HAV Full Syn MV ATF Pennzoil Plat LVMW ATF Versatrans LV Dex VI ATF FullSyn MV ATF

27 (I) Triton Synthetic Transoil 50 5 gallon 149.80 No bid 327.40 71.50 127.50 No bid No bid
28 (I) Triton Synthetic Transoil 50 Bulk per gallon 33.68 No bid No bid No bid 27.50 26.78 No bid

Oil Brand: Chevron Shell Performance Plus Phillips 66 Com 2
Oil Type: CHV Delo Syn-Trans HD Spirax S6 GME40 Triton Transoil 50 Trans Fluilsue 50 Full Syn

29 (J) Tractor Hydraulic Fluid, PowerTran 5 gallon 74.90 75.00 No bid 52.50 49.50 40.80 71.15
30 (J) Tractor Hydraulic Fluid, PowerTran Bulk per gallon 11.53 11.76 No bid 9.00 7.99 8.16 12.35

Oil Brand: Chevron Shell Performance Plus Kenball Com 2 Chevron
Oil Type: CHV 1000 THF Spirax S4 TXM Hyken 052 J20C Hytrons 1000 THF 

31 (K) Universal Gear Lubricant 80-90 5 gallon 76.65 No bid 112.15 77.00 61.00 74.97 79.80
Oil Brand: Chevron Shell Performance Plus Phillips 66 Com 2 Chevron
Oil Type: CHV Delo Gear EP-5 Spirax S4 AX 80W90 MP Gear 80W90 80W90 GL-5 Delo Gear EP5 80W90

32 (L) Universal Gear Lubricant 85-140 5 gallon 76.65 No bid 112.40 84.50 68.00 75.93 79.80

BULK OIL

Alexis Deaton
318-757-7610 ext 709

adeaton@delta360.energy  
Stephanie Brown

318-757-7610 ext 602
lcorders@delta360.energy

 Brittney Palomino
337-304-3021

brittney@cherokeeserviceslc.comDe
vin Palomino
337-304-6340

devin@cherokeeserviceslc.com

Cusdtomer Service                 337-
602-6781

lcsales@breauxpetroleum.com           
Hilary Caldarera

337-274-3307
hilaryc@breauxpetroleum.com

Scott Bemko
346-610-0155

bemko.scott@safety-kleen.com
Leonard Lapham

781-427-3060
lapham.leonard@safety-kleen.com             

non-responsive

Jana Sexton
337-365-3784

orders@miguezfuel.com
George Aitken
337-365-3784

gaitken@miguezfuel.com

John Cassell
337-396-0579

jccassell91@gmail.com

Customer Solutions                               
888-256-1350/800-256-1250

order@gaubertoil.com
Allison Ledet
985-803-6432

allison.ledet@gaubertoil.com

SB-2025-PW-165 

November 8, 2025 until October 31, 2026
Division of Engineering & Public Works



Delta Fuel Co. LLC Cherokee Services LLC Breaux Petroleum                              Safety-Kleen Systems, Inc Miguez Fuel, LLC CG Elite LLC Gaubert Oil

Bid Item:

Effective Period:
 Dept Personnel: 10% Bid Preference 10% Bid Preference 10% Bid Preference 10% Bid Preference 10% Bid Preference

Item# Engine Oils UOM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

BULK OIL

Alexis Deaton
318-757-7610 ext 709

adeaton@delta360.energy  
Stephanie Brown

318-757-7610 ext 602
lcorders@delta360.energy

 Brittney Palomino
337-304-3021

brittney@cherokeeserviceslc.comDe
vin Palomino
337-304-6340

devin@cherokeeserviceslc.com

Cusdtomer Service                 337-
602-6781

lcsales@breauxpetroleum.com           
Hilary Caldarera

337-274-3307
hilaryc@breauxpetroleum.com

Scott Bemko
346-610-0155

bemko.scott@safety-kleen.com
Leonard Lapham

781-427-3060
lapham.leonard@safety-kleen.com             

non-responsive

Jana Sexton
337-365-3784

orders@miguezfuel.com
George Aitken
337-365-3784

gaitken@miguezfuel.com

John Cassell
337-396-0579

jccassell91@gmail.com

Customer Solutions                               
888-256-1350/800-256-1250

order@gaubertoil.com
Allison Ledet
985-803-6432

allison.ledet@gaubertoil.com

SB-2025-PW-165 

November 8, 2025 until October 31, 2026
Division of Engineering & Public Works

Oil Brand: Chevron Shell Performance Plus Phillips 66 Com 2 Chevron
Oil Type: CHV Delo Gear EP-5 Spirax S4 AX 85W140 MP Gear 85W140 85W140 GL-5 Delo Gear EP5 85W140

33 (M) Triton Synthetic Transoil (75-90) Quart 8.18 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
34 (M) Triton Synthetic Transoil (75-90) 5 gallon 151.50 No bid No bid 100.00 119.00 72.00 No bid

Oil Brand: Chevron Performance Plus Phillips 66 Pure Guard
Oil Type: CHV Delo Syn-Gear XDM Triton Synlobe 75W90 75W90 Full Syn

35 (N) Castrol (10W-30) Quart  12qt/cs  3.35 No bid No bid No bid 2.99 3.17 42.30/cs 
36 (N) Castrol (10W-30) 5 gallon N/A No bid No bid No bid 45.00 No bid 64.00
37 (N) Castrol (10W-30) 55 gallon 737.85 No bid No bid 520.00 479.00 445.78 796.95
38 (N) Castrol (10W-30) Bulk per gallon 12.85 No bid No bid 8.50 6.99 8.06 13.31

Oil Brand: Chevron Performance Plus Omni/Pureguard Com 2 Chevron
Oil Type: CHV Supreme SynBlend SynBlend 10W30 10W30 Synblend Supreme 10W30

Item# Facility
Price Per Gallon
Bidder Will Pay

Price Per Gallon
Bidder Will Pay

Price Per Gallon
Bidder Will Pay

Price Per Gallon
Bidder Will Pay

Price Per Gallon
Bidder Will Pay

Price Per Gallon
Bidder Will Pay

39 (O) Waste Oil Tank Capacity - 1000 gallons
(East and West Maintenance Facilities) Price per gallon No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

40 (O) Waste Oil Tank Capacity - 150 gallons
(Mosquito Control) Price per gallon No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

41 (P) Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF) 2.5 gallon 10.25 10.75 9.75 13.50 7.99 8.66 9.75/jug
42 (P) Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF) 5 gallon N/A 21.50 No bid No bid 22.00 No bid No bid
43 (P) Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF) Bulk per gallon 2.15 2.20 2.25 2.40 2.29 1.95 1.95

Oil Brand: Musket Blue Sky Performance Plus Sky Blue Quality/Pureguard & Blue Blood CF Industres
Oil Type: Musket DEF Blue DEF DEF  DEF DEF

44 (Q) T5X Heavy Duty Diesel Oil (SAE 30) Quart 4.83 No bid No bid No bid 39.99 No bid No bid
45 (Q) T5X Heavy Duty Diesel Oil (SAE 30) 5 gallon 77.25 No bid No bid No bid 59.00 85.00 64.10
46 (Q) T5X Heavy Duty Diesel Oil (SAE 30) Bulk per gallon 14.85 No bid No bid No bid 9.99 14.28 10.99

Oil Brand: Chevron Phillips 66 Shell Chevron
Oil Type: CHV Delo 400 T5X Fleet 30 Rotella T1 Sae30 URSA SP 30

47 ® Mobilgard 12 Series (SAE 30) 5 gallon N/A No bid 109.15 No bid 59.00 85.00 No bid
48 ® Mobilgard 12 Series (SAE 30) Bulk per gallon N/A No bid No bid No bid 9.99 14.28 No bid

Oil Brand: Shell Phillips 66 Shell
Oil Type: Rotella T130 T5X Fleet 30 Rotella T1 Sae30

49 (S) Megaflow TM 20 Series (DTE 26) 55 gallon 690.80 480.00 675.51 500.00 480.00 602.77 675.95
Oil Brand: Chevron Chevron Shell Performance Plus Phillips 66 Shell Chevron
Oil Type: CHV Rando HD AW68 Tellus S2 MX68 Megafow AW68 Tellus S2 MX68 Rando HD 68

50 (T) DTE 20 Series (DTE 26) 55 gallon 690.80 No bid 675.51 No bid 480.00 602.77 675.95
Oil Brand: Chevron Shell Phillips 66 Shell Chevron
Oil Type: CHV Rando HD Tellus S2 MX68 Megafow AW68 Tellus S2 MX68 Rando HD 68

51 (U) Mobil Delvac 1 Automatic Transmission Fluid Quart 8.92 No Bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
52 (U) Mobil Delvac 1 Automatic Transmission Fluid 5 gallon 168.40 No Bid 210.68 109.00 169.00 No bid 183.25

Oil Brand: Chevron Shell Performance Plus Phillips 66 Castol
Oil Type: CHV Delo Syn ATF 668 Spirax S6 ATF A668 Triton HD ATF Transynd 668

WASTE OIL - PER GALLON PRICE BIDDER WILL PAY THE PARISH (CPPJ) FOR ITS WASTE OIL - AS IS
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