
Bid Number: SB-2025-PW-154
Effective Period: October 1, 2025 until March 31, 2026

 Dept Personnel: Division of Engineering & Public Works (Stormwater)
Item# Description EACH Qty. 2 - 25 Qty. 26 - 50 EACH Qty. 2 - 25 Qty. 26 - 50 EACH Qty. 2 - 25 Qty. 26 - 50 EACH Qty. 2 - 25 Qty. 26 - 50

1 Radio Transmitter – Programmed to 171.025 395.00 395.00 395.00 450.00 395.00 350.00 725.00 677.04 655.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid

2a Solar Panel - 5W Solar Panel, with mounting bracket, hardware, 
and minimum 15-foot cable. No Bid No Bid No Bid 400.00 355.00 300.00 195.00 181.82 175.95 259.40 246.43 246.43

2b Solar Panel – 10W Solar Panel, with mounting bracket, hardware, and 
minimum 15-foot cable. No Bid No Bid No Bid 475.00 405.00 355.00 242.60 225.62 218.34 379.00 322.15 303.20

3 Antennas
VHF Omni-directional No Bid No Bid No Bid 165.00 160.00 155.00 518.00 481.74 466.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand and model number (if different): 

GPS No Bid No Bid No Bid 95.00 95.00 95.00 298.00 277.14 268.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 Surge Protector – DC blocked, Polyphaser IS-50 or equal No Bid No Bid No Bid 205.00 195.00 175.00 298.00 277.14 268.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 Rain Gauge Section / Tipping Bucket No Bid No Bid No Bid 750.00 720.00 685.00 1800.00 1800.00 1800.00 729.00 729.00 692.55

6a Standard Pressure Transducer – SDI-12 including 50-foot 
vented cable No Bid No Bid No Bid 1850.00 1650.00 1300.00 1320.00 1227.60 1188.00 1465.63 1465.63 1392.35

6b Rugged Pressure Transducer – 50’ cable No Bid No Bid No Bid 2150.00 1950.00 1800.00 1545.00 1479.63 1431.90 1465.63 1465.63 1392.35

6c Price per additional foot of vented cable No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.00 4.00 3.50 2.87 2.87 2.87 1.89 1.89 1.89

7a Radar – Water Level Sensor No Bid No Bid No Bid 1725.00 1725.00 1725.00 1975.00 1836.75 1777.50 1800.75 1800.75 1800.75

7b Radar – Surface Velocity No Bid No Bid No Bid 3950.00 3899.00 3800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8a ALERT2 Encoder and Modulator 1850.00 1850.00 1850.00 1690.00 1679.00 1650.00 1150.00 1385.70 1341.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

8b Data Logger No Bid No Bid No Bid 4660.00 4600.00 4500.00 1150.00 1069.50 900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

9 Bubbler Sensor – Water level sensor No Bid No Bid No Bid 2800.00 2800.00 2800.00 3915.00 3670.70 3566.00 2803.50 2803.50 2803.50

10 All-In-One Sensor No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2400.00 2232.00 2160.00 3379.95 3379.95 2534.96

11 Wind Sensor – as specified No Bid No Bid No Bid 1100.00 995.00 950.00 1211.50 1211.50 1211.50 1515.26 1515.26 1515.26

12 Transmitter Package – as specified 2345.00 2345.00 2345.00 5050.00 4750.00 4550.00 3050.00 3050.00 3050.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

13 Accessory Package – as specified No Bid No Bid No Bid 3700.00 3650.00 3550.00 4000.00 4000.00 4000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Secondary Contact Julie Van Wie 720-252-4300 julie@bluewaterdesign.com Andy Williams 916-374-1800 awilliams@hdyrolynx.com William Ho 800-949-3766 FSSupport@otthydromet.com

Brand name and Model Number: HydroLynx  ANT GPS, ANT 3dBd Omini VHF, CS451 PT, RainVue2
Primary Contact David Van Wie 720-334-7358 vanwie@bluewaterdesign.com Ravi Gopal 615-270-1400 ravig@hydrolynx.com Devon.LaBrum@campbellsci.com 435-227-9000 Jeremy Thompson  601-467-0361  jeremy.thompson@otthydromet.com

Brand name and Model Number: HydroLynx 5050WS and 5050WD RM Young 05103-L1-PT Lufft WS200 Weather Sensor SDI-12 Wind

Brand name and Model Number: A2RT-RTU-BP HydroLynx 50388/A2 - Panel ALBERT205-F1-P-NA

Brand Name and Model Number: Kisters HS40AFC/3100 compact LevelVueB10 & Desiccator Kit OTT compact bubbler sensor-5mm accuracy and 50' range

Brand name and Model Number: ClimaVue50 G2 Lufft WS601 - All in one weather sensor

Brand Name and Model Number: Blue Water Design A2RT HydroLynx G2012/E-HDR AL200x

Brand Name and Model Number: HydroLynx 50388 he CR300 has been discontinued replaced by the CR3

Brand Name and Model Number: Kisyers HyQuant L50 CS475A has been retired. Replaced by the RangeVue1 OTT Water Level Rader Sensor 

Brand Name and Model Number: Kisters RQ-30+

Brand Name and Model Number: HydroLynx, 5050P-MS Campbell Scientific RainVue20 Sutron Rain Gauge 205mm Tipping Bucket Rain Gauge 
w/siphon 0.01in

Brand Name and Model Number: Acculevel-SDI, 5050LL-PTK OTT PIS-500 Submersible Pressure Transducer with 50' 
cable & Fad 4

Brand Name and Model Number: Polyphaser ISB50LN

Brand Name and Model Number: SLD, SLP-005S, 15FT. Cable and mount bracket 3911-1050 / 2271-1037 / 6411-1017-3

Brand Name and Model Number: SLD, SLP-005S, 15FT. Cable and mount bracket 3911-1050 / 2271-1037 / 6411-1017-3

Brand Name and Model Number: Ritron DTX-145 Maxon, 125 V2E-L

720-334-7358 916-374-1800
435-227-9000                                                                  

435-227-9091 (f) 800-949-3766

vanwie@bluewaterdesign.us awilliams@hydrolynx.com devon.labrum@campbellsci.com fssupport@otthydromet.com

Bid Item: Water Level Monitoring Station Parts Blue Water Design Technologies LLC HydroLynx Systems Inc Campbell Scientific Inc
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                     

OTT Hydromet Corp

David Van Wie Andrew Willaims DeVon LaBrum Jeremy Thompson
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