Bid Type: Sign Blanks Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor
Newman Signs Inc Vulcan Inc. dba
Bid Number: SB-2025-PW-155 non-responsive Lightle Enterprises of Ohio LLC Vulcan Signs Osburn Associates Inc

Effective Period:

October 1, 2025 until September 30, 2026

Personnel Dept:

Div of Engineering & Public Works

Dani Paul
800-437-9770
dpaul@newmansigns.com

David R Lightle
740-998-5363

dlightle@lightleenterprises.com

David B Beviacqua
800-663-6845
vulcan3@vulcaninc.com

Josh Goutten
704-385-6569
sales@osburns.com

740-998-5364 (f)

251-943-1544 (f)

704-385-8016 (f)

ITEM # DESCRIPTION

1 36" Round 35.09 40.14 29.41 34.20

2 36" Triangle 16.66 20.20 15.15 18.70

3 48" Triangle 30.09 35.80 25.67 29.92

4 30" Octagon 21.32 27.50 20.82 22.44

5 36" Octagon 31.26 40.14 29.29 32.16

6 48" Octagon 56.11 71.36 50.99 56.34

7 18" Diamond $9.32 10.04 $7.92 $8.42

8 24" Diamond 15.04 17.84 13.44 14.96

9 30" Diamond 22.36 27.88 21.52 23.38
10 36" Diamond 31.34 40.14 30.70 33.66
11 18" Square $9.32 10.04 $7.92 $8.42
12 24" Square 15.04 17.84 13.44 14.96
13 30" Square 22.36 27.88 21.52 23.38
14 36" Square 31.34 40.14 30.70 33.66
15 48" Square 56.19 71.36 53.18 59.84
16 24" Pentagon 16.12 17.84 14.20 15.20
17 30" Pentagon 22.36 27.88 21.93 23.75
18 36" Pentagon 32.42 40.14 30.58 34.20
19 6" x 12" Rectangle 4.15 2.23 3.34 1.90
20 8" x 24" Rectangle 6.87 5.98 6.09 5.07
21 12" x 18" Rectangle 6.88 6.69 5.54 5.70
22 12" x 30" Rectangle 10.14 11.15 8.62 9.50
23 12" x 36" Rectangle 11.76 13.38 $10.81 $11.40
24 12"x72" Rectangle 21.55 26.76 $20.99 $22.80
25 18" x 12" Rectangle $6.88 $6.69 $5.54 $5.70
26 18" x 24" Rectangle $11.76 $13.38 $10.36 $11.40
27 24" x 8" Rectangle 6.87 $5.98 5.39 5.07
28 24" x 10" Rectangle 7.96 No Bid 6.36 6.25
29 24" x 12" Rectangle 8.51 No Bid 7.29 7.48
30 24" x 30" Rectangle 18.29 No Bid $17.22 $18.70
31 24" x 36" Rectangle 21.55 No Bid $20.75 $22.44
32 30" x 12" Rectangle 10.68 No Bid $8.62 $9.35
33 30" x 36" Rectangle 26.45 No Bid 25.72 28.05
34 30" x 48" Rectangle 34.58 No Bid 33.56 37.40
35 30" x 60" Rectangle 47.45 No Bid 42.77 46.75
36 36" x 12" Rectangle 11.76 No Bid 10.22 11.22
37 48" x 18" Rectangle 21.55 No Bid 20.48 22.44
38 48" x 24" Rectangle 28.08 No Bid 27.02 29.92
39 40" x 30" Isosceles Triangle 16.26 No Bid 26.95 24.94
40 48" x 36" Isosceles Triangle 21.55 No Bid 37.61 42.65
41 12" x 36" Hazard Marker 1.76 No Bid 0.81 1.22
42 6" x 18" Flat Blade 4.98 No Bid 3.82 2.81
43 6" x 24" Flat Blade 5.79 No Bid 4.77 3.74
44 6" x 30" Flat Blade 6.60 No Bid 5.90 4.68
45 6" x 36" Flat Blade 7.42 No Bid 6.85 5.61
46 24" County Route Marker $15.04 No Bid $15.12 $15.20
47 9" x 30" Flat Blade 8.65 No Bid 7.68 7.01
48 9" x 36" Flat Blade 7.42 No Bid 9.84 8.42
49 9" x 42" Flat Blade 11.08 No Bid 11.84 9.80
50 9" x 48" Flat Blade 12.31 No Bid 12.70 11.22
51 9" x 54" Flat Blade 15.55 No Bid 14.83 12.60
52 9" x 60" Flat Blade 19.49 No Bid 16.33 14.03
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