Bid Title

Herbicides and Weed Control Chemicals Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor
Bid Number RN AT 50 0 A The Orion Companies Red River Specialties LLC Nutrien AG Solutions Helena Agri-Enterprises LLC
Target Specialty Products
$B-2025-PW-144 Final
Effective Period August 1, 2025 until January 31, 2026 Steve Longwell Timothy Roark Chad Chambliss Duane Whittaker Gail Sloan
225.939-9169 337-884-9750 409-224-9332 512-492-5897 337-288-8128

Non s chad. s.com duane com om

Kirsti.Rodney@T arget-Sj ity.com bryan, @ om wesley. com com

Item |Description Container Size list on bid Unit Price Per Gallon Unit Price Per Gallon Unit Price Per Gallon Unit Price Per Gallon Unit Price Per Gallon
250 Gallon $17.25 $25.88 51835 $19.97 (270 gallon)
. 2-4-D Amine type liquid, complete as per (DOTD# 30 Gallon $17.25 $25.98 $18.55 $20.92
10-94-1050) Lead time 1 Day 5 Days ARO 2-5 Days 2-3 Working Days
Product Offered Alligare 2 4D Weedar 64 Platoon 2, 4-D Amine
2.5 Gallon $13.10 $17.02 51455 $14.10)
) Ranger Pro or Equivalent: 265 Gallon $1225 $16.74 $13.50 $13.22]
41% active ingredient Lead time 1 Day 3 Days (2.5). 5 Days (265) 2-5 Days 2-3 Working Days
Product Offered Credit 41 Ranger Pro Credit 41 Extra Credit 41 Extral
2.5 Gallon $13.85 52025 $19.56 $17.80)
N Roundup Pro Concentrate, complete as per 265 Gallon $13.01 $19.88 SI18.15 $16.60)
(DOTD# 10-94-1920) Lead time 1 Day 3 Days (2.5). 5 Days (265) 2.5 Days 2-3 Working Days
Product Offered Ag Saver Roundup Pro Concentrate Roundup Pro Concentrate Credit 5.4 Exiral
Roundup Custom or Equivalent: For Aquatic. Active Ingredient: 2.5 gallon $21.60 $24.98 $23.20 $22.00
. GZE:;"?;‘;T;E:“;"S‘::’.h‘s";‘;‘“‘:‘(}‘)ﬁ‘)jly cine, in ‘h°4i’f‘“T"l::‘s 250 Gallon $20.90 $24.48 $22.70 $21.70 (265 Gallon)
Awarded Bidder must supply electric pump for entire term of Lead time 1 Day 3 Days (2.5). 5 Days (265) 25 Days 2:3 Working Days|
the contract. Product Offered Aquaneat. Aquamaster Aquaneat Aquamaster
250 Gallon $50.75 §54.55 $60.00 $57.00)
5 Nufarm Polaris or Equivalent Lead time 1 Day 7-10 Days 2-5 Days 2-3 Working Days|
Product Offered Imaz 2SL / Eco Imaz. Arsenal Herbicide Exomazapur 2 SL Ecomazapyr 2 SL|
1 Gallon or 2.5 Gallon $16.05 $17.98 $18.00 $39.47 (1 gallon)
6 Promate Trail Blazer Dye or Equivalent: Lead time 1 Day 3 Days 2-5 Days 2-3 Working Days
Product Offered Novit SM Dye RRSI IVM Marking Dye Blue Wing Spray Indicator
; Tndce o Equilent 0% aeive o ioni st bl i:ﬂj“‘"l::: 1“;:9 1523 20 2531; w v Slﬁ -
for Aquatic y ays ays orking Days
Product Offered Novita 90 Elitc Champion Force 90 Tnlet]
2.5 Gallon $17.25 No Bid $18.95 $20.92]
s Platoon or Equivalent: 265 Gallon $17.25 No Bid 51835 $19.97 (270 gallon)
Lead time 1 Day No Bid 2-5 Days 2-3 Working Days
Product Offered ‘Alligare 2 4D No Bid Platoon 2, 4-D Amine
1 Pint $1.95 No Bid No Bid $14.00 (1 quart),
N V-Drift Adjuvant or Equiv 1 Gallon $15.29 $12.65 $9.50 $39.14]
Lead time 1 Day 3 Days 2-5 Days 2-3 Working Days|
Product Offered Novita Drift RRSI 1% Drift Control Reign ProMate Accuracy|
RRSINIS Surfactant or Active Ings 100% Price Per Gallon $8.05 $12.76 $15.00 No Bid|
10 Alkylarylpolyethylene glycols, free fatty acids, and components Lead time | Day 3 Days 2-5 Days No Bid|

ineffective as an adjuvant.

Product Offered Novita 90 RRSI NIS Force 90 No Bid|
No less than 265 Gallon $30.05 $34.88 $32.00 $24.00)
1" Target 6 Plus or equivalent Lead time 1 Day 3 Days 2-5 Days 2-3 Working Days|
Product Offered Target 6 MSMA 6 Plus MSMA 6 Plus Target 6 Plus|
2.5 Gallon $1,509.12 $1,509.12 $1,509.12 $1,509.12|
12 Esplanade 200 SC or Equivalent Lead time 1 Day 3 Days 2-5 Days 2-3 Working Days
Product Offered Esplanade 200 SC. Esplanade 200SC Esplanade 200SC Esplanade 200SC
2.5 gallon $29.75 $52.25 54035 $37.50)
3 Triclopyr 3 or Equivalent 270 Gallon $29.00 No Bid $39.15 $37.00)
Lead time 1 Day 3 Days 2.5 Days 2-3 Working Days
Product Offered Tahoe 3 Garlon 3A Triclopyr 3 Triclopyr 3
250 Gallon 88.20 $102.45 $103.75 $105.11 (270 gallon),
14 Polaris Ac Complete or Equivalent Lead time 1 Day 7-10 Days 2-5 Days 2-3 Working Days|
Product Offered Imaz 4SL Arsenal AC Polaris AC Complete Imazapyr 45L
250 Gallon 52795 $39.70 $28.78 $27.78 (270 gallon)
15 Dicamba HD or Equivalent Lead time 1 Day 3 Days 2-5 Days 2-3 Working Days
Product Offered Dic 4 Alligare Clash Rifle Dicamba 4|
270 Gallon $48.75 $68.24 $51.20 $51.00)
16 Triumph 22K or Equivalent Lead time 1 Day 7-10 Days 2-5 Days 2-3 Working Days|
Product Offered Picture Tordon 22k Triumph 22k Triumph 22K|
1 Gallon $750.00 $750.00 $738.00 $750.00
17 Detaill or Equivalent: Active Ingredient; 29.74a% Saflufenacil Lead time | Day 3 Days 2.5 Days 2.3 Working Days
Product Offered Detail Detail Detail Detail
15 Gallon $90.00 $112.48 $107.75 $105.26 (1 gallon)
18 Plateau or Equivalent Lead time 1 Day 7-10 Days 2-5 Days 2-3 Working Days|
Product Offered Panoramic Platcau Platcau Panoramic 2SL
2.5 Gallon $364.80 $364.80 $364.80 $364.80
19 Method 240 SL or Equivalent Lead time 1 Day 3 Days ARO 2-5 Days 2-3 Working Days
Product Offered Method Method 240 SL Method 240SL Method 240 SL
60 oz $9.69/0z 9.69/0z $9.69 $9.69/07
20 Derigo or Equivalent Lead time 1 Day 3 Days ARO 2-5 Days 2-3 Working Days|
Product Offered Derigo Derigo Derigo Derigo|
20 0z $9.60 $11.48 $11.00 $10.23
21 OutRider or Equivalent Lead time 1 Day 3 Days ARO 2-5 Days 2-3 Working Days
Product Offered Herald Cryder Outrider Cryder
31b $24.98 $26.60 $28.35 $25.31
22 Dupont Oust XP or Equivalent Lead time 1 Day 3 Days ARO 2-5 Days 2-3 Working Days|
Product Offered Oust XP Oust XP Oust XP Oust XP
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