Bid Title
Bid Number

Effective Period
Dept Personnel

Canine & Feline Food

SB-2025-AS-151

August 8, 2025 until July 31, 2026
Animal Services

Vendor

Hill's Pet Nutrition
Kathy Reeves
kathy_reeves@hillspet.com

1-800-354-4557
Customer Service

customerservice@hillspet.com

Vendor

Team Dog Virtual LLC
Jeff Gamber
jeff@teamdog.shop

727-481-4040
Michael Black

mblack@teamdog.shop

# Description Form Size Code Price Form Size Code Price
SCIENCE DIET® CANINE Life Stage Products

1 DOG Pro Pack -Science Diet® Adult Chicken & Barley Recipe Dry 35 pound bag 603916 $33.43 33 pound bag TD-ES-CS-33 $88.00

2 DOG Science Diet® Adult Chicken & Barley Recipe (Backup) Dry 35 pound bag 11000 $67.01 33 pound bag TD-ES-CS-33 $88.00

3 PUPPY Pro Pack -Science Diet® Chicken & Brown Rice Recipe Dry 35 pound bag 603920 $35.47 33 pound bag TD-ES-CS-33 $88.00

4 PUPPY Science Diet® Chicken & Brown Rice Recipe (Backup) Dry 27.5 pound bag 607792 $62.31 33 pound bag TD-ES-CS-33 $88.00

5 CAT Pro Pack -Science Diet® Adult Chicken Recipe Dry 20 pound bag 6801 $32.50 no bid

6 CAT Science Diet® Adult Chicken Recipe (Backup) Dry 16 pound bag 10405 $48.64 no bid

7 KITTEN Pro Pack -Science Diet® Chicken Recipe Dry 35 pound bag 2092 $55.95 no bid

8 KITTEN Science Diet® Chicken Recipe (Backup) Dry 15.5 pound bag 9392 $48.64 no bid

9 Pro Pack -Science Diet® Sensitive Stomach & Skin for Dogs Dry 35 pound bag 603768 $38.08 33 pound bag TD-ES-CS-33 $88.00

10 Pro Pack -Science Diet® Sensitive Stomach & Skin for Cats Dry 20 pound bag 4046 $36.72 no bid
SCIENCE DIET® CANINE Wet

11 PUPPY Chicken & Barley Entrée Canned 12 x 13 oz 7036 $31.80 no bid

12 ADULT Beef & Barley Entrée Canned 12 x 13 oz 7039 $31.80 no bid

13 ADULT Chicken & Barley Entrée Canned 12x 13 oz. 7037 $31.80 no bid
SCIENCE DIET® FELINE Wet

14 KITTEN Liver & Chicken Entrée Minced Canned 24 x 5.5 oz. 6600 $43.20 no bid

15 KITTEN Liver & Chicken Entrée Minced (Backup) Canned 24 x2.9o0z. 10807 $32.16 no bid

16 ADULT Liver & Chicken Entrée Minced Canned 24 x 5.5 oz. 6610 $43.20 no bid

17 ADULT Savory Chicken Entrée Minced (Backup) Canned 24 x5.50z. 4534 $43.20 no bid
Prescription Diet® Brand Pet Foods - Canine

18 ald® Canine/Feline Urgent Care with Chicken Canned 24 x 5.5 oz. 5670 $58.71 no bid

19 i/d® Canine Digestive Care with Turkey Canned 12x 13 oz. 7008 $39.30 no bid

20 i/d® Canine Digestive Care Chicken Flavor Dry 8.5 pound bag 8618 $39.30 33 pound bag TD-ES-CS-33 $88.00
Prescription Diet® Brand Pet Foods - Feline

21 i/d® Feline Digestive Care with Chicken Minced 24 x5 1/2 oz. cans 4628 $54.35 no bid

22 Feline Sensitive Stomach & Skin Chicken Flavor Pro Pack Dry 20 pound bag 4046 $36.72 no bid
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