Bid Title: Assorted Pipes and Fittings Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor
Bid Number:| 5B-2025-PW-141 Coastal Culvert & Supply Inc Coburns Supply Ferguson Enterprises LLC Southern Pipe & Supply CGElite LLC
Terry Brown Charles Cowart Tommy Welch Kelli Diamond jecassell91@gmail.com
Effective: July 25, 2025 - December 31, 2025 Final m m thomas.welch: kelli m i
337-546-6887 337-474-0526 337-625-3300 337-436-9700 (0) 337-515-3148 (c) 337-396-0579
337-546-6889 (1) 337-474-0987 (f) 337-494-7109 ()
Dept Pers: Division of Engineering & Public Works Leah Zaunbrecher, Mark Tate Tykler Schexnayder Logan Mimms Andrew Gary
m m logan m
10% Bid Preference 10% Bid Preference
BID AMT BID AMT BID AMT BID AMT BID AMT
Corrugated Metal Pipe
Item #]ROUND PIPE (Price Per Foot) Brand Name: Brand Name: Brand Name: Brand Name: Brand Name:
Contech Contech Tow bid with 10%
434.00 450.70 No bid No bid 434.00
530.00 550.20 No bid No bid 530.00
3 X1" 607.00 630.80 No bid No bid 607.00
3" X1" 680.00 708.18 No bid No bid 680.00
3" X1" 785.00 817.00 No bid No bid 785.00
ILOUND PIPE (Price per 24 " Band) Brand Name: Brand Name: Brand Name: Brand Name: Brand Name:
CORRUGATION Contech Con-tech
6 37X1" 1,300.00 1,416.75 No bid No bid 1300.00
7 3" X1" 1,590.00 1,728.75 No bid No bid 1590.00
8 37X1" 1,820.00 1,981.74 No bid No bid 1820.00
9 3" X1" 2,050.00 2,224.15 No bid No bid 2050.00
10 37X1" 2,375.00 2,565.30 No bid No bid 2375.00
[ARCHED PIPE (Price Per Foot) Brand Name: Brand Name: Brand Name: Brand Name: Brand Name:
ARCH SPAN & RISE CORRUGATION Contech Contech
11 17x13 2-2/3"x1/2" 41.40 42.90 No bid No bid 41.40
12 21x15 2-2/3"x1/2" 49.50 51.50 No bid No bid 49.50
13 2820 2-2/3"x1/2" 91.00 94.40 No bid No bid 91.00
14 35x24 2-2/3"x1/2" 113.00 117.30 No bid No bid 113.00
15 42x29 2-2/3"x1/2" 134.90 140.15 No bid No bid 134.90
16 49x33 2-2/3"x1/2" 157.00 163.05 No bid No bid 157.00
17 57x38 2-2/3"x1/2" 196.88 204.55 No bid No bid 196.88
18 60x46 3"x1" 252.00 261.20 No bid No bid 252.00
19 66x51 37x1" 292.00 302.65 No bid No bid 292.00
20 81x59 3"x1" 488.00 505.90 No bid No bid 488.00
21 95 x 67 37x1" 595.00 617.30 No bid No bid 595.00
22 112x75 3"x1" 682.00 707.65 No bid No bid 682.00
23 128x83 108 10 37x1" 768.50 794.95 No bid No bid 768.50
24 142 x 91 120 10 3"x1" 883.00 916.05 No bid No bid 883.00
|ARCHED PIPE (Price per 24 " Band)
Brand Name: Brand Name: Brand Name: Brand Name: Brand Name:
ARCH SPAN & RISE CORRUGATION Con-tech Con-tech
25 17x13 2-2/3"x1/2" 124.17 134.60 No bid No bid 124.17
26 21x15 2-2/3"x1/2" 149.00 161.50 No bid No bid 149.00
27 28420 2-2/3"x1/2" 273.20 296.10 No bid No bid 273.20
28 35x24. 2-2/3"x1/2" 340.00 367.85 No bid No bid 340.00
29 42x29 2-2/3"x1/2" 405.00 439,65 No bid No bid 405.00
30 49x33 2-2/3"x1/2" 475.00 511.45 No bid No bid 475.00
31 57x38 2-2/3"x1/2" 595.00 641.55 No bid No bid 595.00
32 60x46 3"x1" 758.00 819.20 No bid No bid 758.00
33 66x51 37x1" 880.00 949.30 No bid No bid 880.00
34 81x59 3"x1" 1,470.00 1,586.75 No bid No bid 1470.00
35 95 x 67 37x1" 1,790.00 1,936.20 No bid No bid 1790.00
36 112x75 3"x1" 2,050.00 2,219.55 No bid No bid 2050.00
37 128x83 37x1" 230000 249330 No bid No bid 2300.00
38 142x91 3"x1" 2,700.00 2,873.10 No bid No bid 2700.00
Price per Each Price per Each Price per Each Price per Each Price per Each
39 12" Riser 14 gauge onto 15" Arch Pipe 12 gauge 620.00 630.45 No bid No bid 620,00
40 15" Riser 14 gauge onto 18" Arch Pipe 12 gauge 775.00 778.25 No bid No bid 775.00
41 15” Riser 14 gauge onto 24” Arch Pipe 12 gauge 940.00 948.90 No bid No bid 940.00
22 TEES FOR ARCHED PIPE 15" Riser 14 gauge onto 30” Arch Pipe 12 gauge 1,025.00 1,040.20 No bid No bid 1025.00
43 24" Riser 14 gauge onto 36" Arch Pipe 12 gauge 1,647.00 1,653.25 No bid No bid 1647.00
44 24" Riser 14 gauge onto 42" Arch Pipe 12 gauge 1,800.00 1,809.75 No bid No bid 1800.00
[5 24" Riser 14 gauge onto 48" Arch Pipe 12 gauge 1,903.00 1,910.85 No bid No bid 1903.00
SPECIFY BRAND NAME OF TEE: I Con-tech Con-tech
46 247 X 120 Yard Roll 215.00 No bid 44.00 No bid 48.40
47 AT [36” X120 Yard Rol 250.00 No bid 65.00 No bid 7150
Corrugated Aluminum Pipe Price Per Foot Price Per Foot Price Per Foot Price Per Foot Price Per Foot
LR ) Brand Name: Brand Name: Brand Name: Brand Name: Brand Name:
ARCH S| Contech Con-tech
48 2/ 21,60 2168 No bid No bid 41.60
49 2/ 76.15 7630 No bid No bid 76.15
50 2/ 9522 95.40 No bid No bid 95.22
51 2/ 115.00 115.15 No bid No bid 115.00
[ Brand Name: Brand Name: Brand Name: Brand Name: Brand Name:
Contech Con-tech
52] 125.00 130.70 No bid No bid 125.00
53 229.00 239.30 No bid No bid 229.00
54] 285.00 299.15 No bid No bid 285.00
55 345,00 361.2 No bid No bid 345.00
SPECIFY CORE ALLOY: 3004 300
SPECIFY CLAD ALLOY: 7072 707.
|ALUMINIZED STEEL PIPE TYPE 2 (Price per Foot and Band)
Brand Name: Brand Name: Brand Name: Brand Name: Brand Name:
DIAMETER| GAUGE| CORRUGATION Contech Con-tech
PRICE/FOOT| 15" 14 2-2/3"x1/2" 31.00 31.05 No bid No bid 31.00
56 PRICE/BAND 15" 14 2-2/3"x1/2" 97.40 97.40 No bid No bid 107.14
PRICE/FOOT| 18" 14 2-2/3"x1/2" 37.20 37.30 No bid No bid 97.40
57 PRICE/BAND 18" 14 2:2/3"x1/2" 116.90 116.90 No bid No bid 128.59
PRICE/FOOT| 24" 12 2-2/3"x1/2" 62.35 62.35 No bid No bid 68.59
58| PRICE/BAND 24" 12 2:2/3"x1/2" 214.30 214.30 No bid No bid 235.73
PRICE/FOOT| _ 30" 12 2-2/3"x1/2" 84.73 84.90 No bid No bid 84.73
59 PRICE/BAND 30" 12 2:2/3"x1/2" 265.00 266.30 No bid No bid 265.00
PRICE/FOOT| 36" 12 2-2/3"x1/2" 101.26 101.45 No bid No bid 101.26
60 PRICE/BAND 36" 12 2:2/3"x1/2" 318.25 318.25 No bid No bid 350.08
PRICE/FOOT| 42" 12 2-2/3"x1/2" 129.57 129.85 No bid No bid 129.57
61 PRICE/BAND 42" 12 2:2/3"x1/2" 405.00 407.25 No bid No bid 405.00
PRICE/FOOT| 48" 12 2-2/3"x1/2" 147.75 148.05 No bid No bid 147.75
62 PRICE/BAND 48" 12 2:2/3"x1/2" 460.00 464.40 No bid No bid 460.00
PRICE/FOOT| 54" 12 3"x1" 188.67 189.05 No bid No bid 188.67
63 PRICE/BAND| 54" 12 3" x1" 593.00 593.00 No bid No bid 652.30
PRICE/FOOT| 60" 12 3"x1" 218.63 219.10 No bid No bid 218.63
64/ PRICE/BAND| 60" 12 3" x1" 687.20 687.20 No bid No bid 755.92
ALUMINUM CORRUGATED ROUND PIPE PRICE PER FOOT PRICE PER FOOT PRICE PER FOOT PRICE PER FOOT PRICE PER FOOT
SIZE (DIAMETER, IN.) UG CORRUGATION BRAND: Contech BRAND: CON-TECH BRAND: BRAND: CON-TECH BRAND: CON-TECH
65 12 16 -2/ /2" 22.55 22.80 No bid No bid 22.55
66 15 16 2-2/3"x 1/2” 28.20 28.25 No bid No bid 28.20
67 18 16 /37 x 1/2” 33.84 33.90 No bid No bid 33.84
68 21 16 2-2/3" x 1/2™ 39.48 39.55 No bid No bid 39.48
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Bid Title: Assorted Pipes and Fittings Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor
Bid Number: $B-2025-PW-141 Coastal Culvert & Supply Inc Coburns Supply Ferguson Enterprises LLC Southern Pipe & Supply CG Elite LLC
Terry Brown Charles Cowart Tommy Welch Kelli Diamond jecassell91@gmail.com
Effective: July 25, 2025 - December 31, 2025 Final m m thomas.welch: m_| kelli m i
337-546-6887 337-474-0526 337-625-3300 337-436-9700 (0) 337-515-3148 () 337-396-0579
337-546-6889 (f) 337-474-0987 (f) 337-494-7109 (f)
Dept Pers: Division of Engineering & Public Works Leah Zaunbrecher Mark Tate Tykler Schexnayder Logan Mimms Andrew Gary
m m logan. m m
10% Bid Preference 10% Bid Preference
69 24 14 22/3"x 1/2” 55.69 55.80 No bid No bid 55.69
70 30 14 2-2/3"x 1/2” 69.09 69.20 No bid No bid 69.09
7 36 12 2-2/3"x 1/2” 114.91 115.15 No bid No bid 11491
72 42 12 2-2/3"x 1/2” 133.95 134.20 No bid No bid 133.95
73 48 10 2-2/3"x 1/2” 194.58 195.00 No bid No bid 194.58
74 54 10 3 x1” No bid No bid No bid No bid
75 60 8 3 x1” No bid No bid No bid No bid
PRICE PER 24" BAND, EACH PRICE PER 24" BAND, EACH PRICE PER 24" BAND, EACH PRICE PER 24" BAND, EACH PRICE PER 24" BAND, EACH
Brand of Pipe: Contech Brand of Pipe: Contech Brand of Pipe: Brand of Pipe: Brand of Pipe:
SIZE (DIAMETER, IN.) GAUGE CORRUGATION Brand of Band: Contech Brand of Band: Con-tech Brand of Band: Brand of Band: Brand of Band:
76 12 16 2-2/3"x 1/2 70.00 72.90 No bid No bid 70.00
77 15 16 2-2/3"x 1/2” 80.00 88.60 No bid No bid 80.00
78 18 16 2-2/3"x 1/2” 105.00 106.35 No bid No bid 105.00
79 21 16 2-2/3"x 1/2” 120.00 124.07 No bid No bid 12000
80 24 14 2-2/3"x 1/2” 170.00 175.05 No bid No bid 170.00
81 30 14 2-2/3"x 1/2” 212.00 217.15 No bid No bid 212.00
82 36 12 2-2/3"x 1/2” 350.00 361.90 No bid No bid 350.00
83 42 12 2-2/3"x 1/2” 410.00 421.00 No bid No bid 410.00
84 48 10 2-2/3"x 1/2” 695.00 611.55 No bid No bid 672.705
85 54 10 3 x1” No bid No bid No bid No bid
86 60 8 3 x1” No bid No bid No bid No bid
PRICE PER FOOT PRICE PER FOOT PRICE PER FOOT PRICE PER FOOT PRICE PER FOOT
ALUMINUM CORRUGATED ARCHED PIPE Brand of Pipe: Contech Brand of Pipe: Con-tech Brand of Pipe: Brand of Pipe: Brand of Pipe:
SIZE (in) [SPAN X RISE] CORRUGATION Brand of Band: Contech Brand of Band: Contech Brand of Band: Brand of Band: Brand of Band:
87 15 - 117 x 131 16 30.89 30.89 No bid No bid 33.979
88 18 - 21 x 151 16 37.60 37.67 No bid No bid 37.60
89 21-124x 181 16 43.86 43.95 No bid No bid 43.86
%0 24 - 28 x 201 14 2-2/3"x 1/2” 61.89 62.00 No bid No bid 61.89
91 30 -135 x 241 14 22/3"x 127 76.77 76.90 No bid No bid 76.77
92 36 -142 x 291 12 127.68 127.95 No bid No bid 127.68
93 42 - 149 x 331 12 148.83 149.15 No bid No bid 148.83
% 48 - [57 x 381 10 216.19 216.65 No bid No bid 216.19
95 54 - 164 x 431 10 No bid No bid No bid No bid
96 60 - [71 x 471 8 No bid No bid No bid No bid
PRICE PER 24" BAND, EACH PRICE PER 24" BAND, EACH PRICE PER 24" BAND, EACH PRICE PER 24" BAND, EACH PRICE PER 24" BAND, EACH
Brand of Pipe: Contech Brand of Pipe: Con-tech Brand of Pipe: Brand of Pipe: Brand of Pipe:
Brand of Band: Contech Brand of Band: Contech Brand of Band: Brand of Band: Brand of Band:
97 15-[17x13] 16 2-2/3"x 1/2” 95.00 101.85 No bid No bid 95.00
98 18 -[21 x 15] 16 2-2/3"x 1/2” 115.00 118.20 No bid No bid 115.00
99 21 -124 x 18] 16 2-2/3"x 1/2” 135.00 137.85 No bid No bid 135.00
100 24 - [28 x 201 14 2-2/3"x 1/2” 190.00 194.50 No bid No bid 190.00
101 30 -135 x 241 14 2-2/3"x 1/2” 240.00 241.30 No bid No bid 240.00
102 36 - [42 x 291 12 2-2/3"x 1/2” 390.00 401.30 No bid No bid 390.00
103 42 - [49 x 331 12 2-2/3"x 1/2” 450.00 467.75 No bid No bid 450.00
104 48 - [57 x 381 10 2-2/3"x 1/2” 695.00 679.50 No bid No bid 695.00
105 54 -[64 x 431 10 3 x1” No bid No bid No bid No bid
106 60 - [71 x 471 8 3 x1” No bid No bid No bid No bid
PRICE PER TEE PRICE PER TEE PRICE PER TEE PRICE PER TEE PRICE PER TEE
ROUND ALUMINUM TEE Brand of Tee: Contech Brand of Tee: Con-Tech Brand of Tee: Brand of Tee: Brand of Tee:
SIZE (DIAMETER, IN.) GAUGE CORRUGATION
107 12 14 -2/37x1/2” 323.31 323.90 No bid No bid 323.31
108 15 14 -2/37x1/: 399.13 400.00 No bid No bid 399.13
109 18 14 -2/37x1/: 484.82 485.85 No bid No bid 484.82
110 24 12 -2/37x1/: 568.33 569.55 No bid No bid 568.33
111 30 12 -2/37x1/: 831.89 833.65 No bid No bid 831.89
112 36 12 -2/37x1/: 1,523.86 1,527.15 No bid No bid 1523.86
113 42 12 -2/37x1/: 1,780.91 1,784.75 No bid No bid 1780.91
114 48 12 -2/37x1/2” 2,398.05 2,403.25 No bid No bid 2398.05
115 54 12 P x 17 3,607.38 3,615.20 No bid No bid 3607.38
116 60 12 Tx 17 No bid No bid No bid No bid
PRICE PER TEE PRICE PER TEE PRICE PER TEE PRICE PER TEE PRICE PER TEE
ARCHED ALUMINUM TEE Brand of Tee: contech Brand of Tee: Con-Tech Brand of Tee: Brand of Tee: Brand of Tee:
SIZE (DIAMETER, IN.) GAUGE CORRUGATION
117 14 : 390.00 468.45 No bid No bid 390.00
118 15 14 468.45 468.45 No bid No bid 515.298
119 18 12 569.55 569.55 No bid No bid 626.505
120 24 12 850.00 851.05 No bid No bid 850.00
121 30 12 1,050.00 1,053.25 No bid No bid 1050.00
122 36 12 1,540.00 1,540.20 No bid No bid 1540.00
123 42 12 2,130.00 2,131.50 No bid No bid 2130.00
124 48 12 2,885.00 2,886.95 No bid No bid 2885.00
125 54 12 4,360.00 4,360.85 No bid No bid 4360.00
126| 60 12 No bid No bid No bid No bid
CAST IRON RING AND GRATE PRICE PER RING & GRATE PRICE PER RING & GRATE PRICE PER RING & GRATE PRICE PER RING & GRATE PRICE PER RING & GRATE
Brand of Ring: SIP Brand of Ring: SI Brand of Ring: SIP Brand of Ring: SIP Brand of Ring: SIP
SIZE (DIAMETER, IN.) GAUGE CORRUGATION Brand of Grate: SIP Brand of Grate: SIP Brand of Grate: SIP Brand of Grate: SIP Brand of Grate: SIP
127 12 14 2-2/3"x1/2" No bid 138.60.
128 15 14 2-2/3"x1/2" No bid 173.80,
129 18 14 2-2/3"x1/2" No bid 218.90
130 24 12 2-2/37x1/2” No bid 358.60.
Price per Foot P PRICE PER FOOT PRICE PER FOOT PRICE PER FOOT PRICE PER FOOT
Size (diameter, in.) Brand of Pipe: ADS Brand of Pipe: ADS Brand of Pipe: ADS Brand of Pipe: ADS Brand of Pipe: ADS
131 12 8.98 9.78 10.75 9.00 8.98
132 15 12.64 13.59 15.42 12.91 12.64
133 18 16.55 17.52 2025 16.90 16.55
134 24 28.44 3034 34.75 29.05 28.44
135 30 42.17 44.60 51.45 43.01 4217
136 36 54.00 56.70 65.30 54.65 54.00
137 42 71.00 73.85 85.00 71.21 71.00
138 48 84.50 88.00 101.00 84.80 84.50
139 60 154.00 159.85 184.00 154.08 15330 154.00
Price per Band PRICE PER Band PRICE PER Band PRICE PER Band PRICE PER Band PRICE PER Band
Size (diameter, in.) Brand of Band: ADS Brand of Band: ADS Brand of Band: ADS Brand of Band: ADS Brand of Band: ADS
140 12 16.00 17.50 18.00 15.97 17.567
141 15 25.70 29.15 30.00 26.45 25.70
142 18 44.00 49.65 51.00 45.28 44.00
143 24 62.00 70.00 72.00 63.81 62.00
144 30 144.00 162.85 167.00 148.20 144.00
145 36 202.00 226.55 233.00 206.65 202.00
146 42 295.00 331.60 341.00 302.49 295.00
147 48 345.00 389.30 401.00 355.03 345.00
148 60 550.00 605.60 624.00 55237 550.00
Price per TEE PRICE PER TEE PRICE PER TEE PRICE PER TEE PRICE PER TEE PRICE PER TEE
Size (diameter, in.) Brand of TEE: ADS Brand of TEE: ADS Brand of TEE: ADS Brand of TEE: ADS Brand of TEE: ADS
149 12 205.00 216.75 238.00 21096 205.00
150 15 308.00 319.50 356.00 31552 308.00
151 18 435.00 448.35 500.00 442.62 435.00
152 24 665.00 693.20 773.00 684.32 665.00
153 30 1,355.00 1,398.50 1,559.00 1,380.94 1355.00
154 36 1,800.00 1,881.80 2,098.00 1,852.47 1800.00
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Bid Title: Assorted Pipes and Fittings Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor
Bid Number: $B-2025-PW-141 Coastal Culvert & Supply Inc Coburns Supply Ferguson Enterprises LLC Southern Pipe & Supply CG Elite LLC
Terry Brown Charles Cowart Tommy Welch Kelli Diamond jecassell91@gmail.com
Effective: July 25, 2025 - December 31, 2025 Final m m thomas.welch: m_| kelli com i
337-546-6887 337-474-0526 337-625-3300 337-436-9700 (0) 337-515-3148 () 337-396-0579
337-546-6889 (f) 337-474-0987 (f) 337-494-7109 (f)
Dept Pers: Division of Engineering & Public Works Leah Zaunbrecher Mark Tate Tykler Schexnayder Logan Mimms Andrew Gary
m m m | logan m
10% Bid Preference 10% Bid Preference
155 42 2,685.00 2,731.10 3,045.00 2,696.11 2685.00
156 48 3,100.00 3,214.10 3,584.00 3,172.88 3100.00
157 60 6,790.00 6,794.65 7,577.00 6,707.40 7378.14
158 12x12x12 reducer tee 295.00 21675 238.00 21096 232.056
159 15x15x12 reducer tee 300.00 31230 348.00 30833
160 18x18x12 reducer tee 350.00 362.60 404.00 357.97 300.00
161 24x24x12 reducer tee 500.00 531.85 593.00 514.83 350.00
162 30x30x12 reducer tee 750.00 779.35 869.00 769.38 500.00
163 15x15x15 reducer tee 308.00 319.50 356.00 31552 750.00
164 18x18x15 reducer tee 412.00 433.60 483.00 348.92 383.812
165 24x24x15 reducer tee 567.00 591.60 660.00 583.50 567.00
166 30x30x15 reducer tee 815.00 849.30 947.00 838.43 815.00
167 36x36x18 reducer tee 1400.00 1,465.50 1,634.00 1,440.86 1400.00
168 42x42x18 reducer tee 1700.00 1,748.65 1,950.00 1,726.09 1700.00
169 42x42x24 reducer tee 2050.00 2,115.07 2,358.00 2,087.85 2050.00
170 48x48x24 reducer tee 2295.00 2,369.85 2,642.00 2,339.23 2295.00
171 60x60x24 reducer tee 5300.00 5,484.62 6,116.00 5300.00
172 60x60x30 reducer tee 5500.00 5,709.30 6,370.00 5500.00
90 Degree Fitting Price per Fitting PRICE PER Fitting PRICE PER Fitting PRICE PER Fitting PRICE PER Fitting
Size (diameter, in.) Brand of Fitting: ADS Brand of Fitting: ADS Brand of Fitting: ADS
173 12 170.00 166.95 181.201
174 15 195.00 201.20 195.00
175 18 272.00 282.27 272.00
176 24 540.00 558.15 540.00
177 30 1,111.00 1,155.10 1111.00
178 36 1,474.00 1,539.07 1474.00
179 42 2,182.00 2,253.00 2182.00
180 48 2,625.00 2,713.20 2625.00
181 60 4,555.00 4,716.30 5,259.00 4,655.73 4555.00
45 Degree Fitting Price per TEE PRICE PER TEE PRICE PER TEE PRICE PER TEE PRICE PER TEE PRICE PER TEE
Size (diameter, in.) Brand of TEE: ADS Brand of TEE: ADS Brand of TEE: ADS Brand of TEE: ADS Brand of TEE: ADS
182 12 190.00 189.60 211.00 187.16 205.876
183 15 200.00 189.60 194.00 17211 189.321
184 18 223.00 23230 259.00 22931 223.00
185 24 455.00 474.40 529.00 468.23 455.00
186 30 770.00 738.80 823.00 729.29 802219
187 36 1,100.00 1,102.25 1,260.00 1,117.06 1110.00
188 42 1,555.00 1,61030 1,793.00 1,589.61 1555.00
189 48 2,000.00 2,063.35 2,200.00 2,036.84 2000.00
190 60 3,000.00 3,133.09 3,400.00 3,087.29 3000.00
Miscellaneous
Product Price Per unit Price per unit Price per unit Price per unit Price per unit
191 Plastic Yard Grate 12" 100.00 64.58 No bid 95.08 71.038]
192 Plastic Yard Grate 15" 200.00 120.26 No bid 13022 132.286
193 Plastic Yard Grate 18" 250.00 143.30 No bid 80.82 88.902
194 Plastic Yard Grate 24" 350.00 No bid No bid 131.60 144.76
Price per Foot PRICE PER FOOT PRICE PER FOOT PRICE PER FOOT PRICE PER FOOT PRICE PER FOOT
Size (diameter, in.) Brand of Pipe: ADS Brand of Pipe: ADS Brand of Pipe: ADS Brand of Pipe: ADS Brand of Pipe: ADS
195 12.00 11.34 12.70 10.60 11.66
196 15 14.70 15.66 18.00 15.03 14.70
197 18 19.80 20.94 24.25 2021 19.80
198 24 35.00 31.90 37.20 30.76 33.836
199 30 50.00 48.80 56.30 47.05 51.755
200 36 72.00 63.95 73.70 61.64 67.804
201 42 88.00 82.45 94.90 79.47 87.417
202 48 122.00 107.80 124.00 103.89 114.279
203 60 160.00 157.40 177.00 148.48 163.328
Price per Tee PRICE PER TEE PRICE PER TEE PRICE PER TEE PRICE PER TEE PRICE PER TEE
Size (diameter, in.) Brand of Pipe: ADS Brand of Pipe: ADS Brand of Pipe: ADS Brand of Pipe: ADS Brand of Pipe: ADS
204 12 325.00 299.40 363.00 28377 312.147
205 15 500.00 43730 531.00 431,67 474.837
206 18 680.00 627.75 700.00 62024 682.264
207 24 1,100.00 970.50 1,082.00 958.04. 1053.844)
208 30 2,203.00 1,958.45 2,183.00 1,93331 2126.641
209 36 2,950.00 2,634.60 2,936.00 2,600.76 2860.836
210 42 3,000.00 2,730.20 3,048.00 2,696.11 2965.721
211 48 3,600.00 3,214.15 3,584.00 3,172.88 3490.168
212 60 7,800.00 6,794.65 7,570.00 6,707.40 7373.§|
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