Bid Title Water Testing Chemicals Vendor Vendor Vendor
. . Thornton, Musso & Bellemin, Delta H20, LLC DBA Delta
Bid Number SB-2025-PW-128 Haywkins Inc. Inc. Chemical Corp
Effective Period June 1, 2025 until November 30, 2025 Chip Nolen Dustin Musso Katie Jo
337-884-3755 337-344-1358 504-733-0630
chip.nolen@hawkinsinc.com dustin@tmbwater.com kjeansonr 1emh20.com
Tyler Mitchell Garrick Musso Office
337-884-9186 337-806-4890 504-733-0630
OffICe:l leltachemhZo.com
tyler.mitchell@hawkinsinc.com gmusso@tmbwater.com or 1:emh20.com
Item Description Container Size Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
As Needed
(Pumped Off Truck) $1.0845/1b| $2.90/1b No Bid
1 Sodium Permanganate 10% or Equivalent Anticipated Lead Time 7-10 days 2-5 days No Bid|
Product Name 58736 - Sodium Permanganate 10% TMB 472 No Bid
15 gallon $0.6092/Ib
$5.24/gal No Bid No Bid|
30 gallon $0.6092/1b ) )
2 Acetic Acid/Hydrogen Peroxide or Equivalent $5.24/gal No Bid No Bid
Anticipated Lead Time 7-10 days| No Bid| No Bid|
PN 62597 - Acetic Acid / Hydrogen|
Peroxide|
Product Name 258 LB DR (30 gal) No Bid| No Bid|
As Needed
(Pumped Off Truck) $0.8413/1b $1.35/Ib $0.79/1b|
} Zine Orthophosphate or Equivalent Anticipated Lead Time 7-10 days 25 days 7-10 business days
Product Name PN 59679 Z0190-ZC TMB 462 CP 721
As Needed
(Pumped Off Truck) $0.5018/1b $0.76/1b| No Bid|
4 Sodium Hypochlorite or Equivalent Anticipated Lead Time 7-10 days 2.5 days No Bid
Product Name PN 41245 AZONE-15 TMB 5651 No Bid
1 gallon $1.0845/1b
$6.76/gal No Bid No Bid
’ $1.0845/1b,
5 Hydrochloric Acid 20 or Equivalent 30 gallon $6.76/gal No Bid| No Bid|
Anticipated Lead Time 7-10 days No Bid No Bid
PN 59595 Hydrochloric Acid 20" |
Product Name 290 LB DR| No Bid| No Bid|
100 pound pail $0.6092/1b $5.33/Ib (501b pail) No Bid
6 Calcium Hypochlorite Granular or Equivalent Anticipated Lead Time 7-10 days 1-2 weeks No Bid|
PN 58111 - Crystal Clear 68 100|
Product Name LB DR Cal Hypo| TMB 5456 No Bid
150 Ib cylinder
(price to include any rental
. . . cost of cylinder) $2.91/Ib No Bid No Bid}
7 Chlorine Cylinders or Equivalent . N - N
Anticipated Lead Time 7-10 days No Bid No Bid
PN 59500 Chlorine - 150 LB CYL]
Product Name EPA 148-707 No Bid No Bid|
45 pound pail $5.5445/1b $6.50/1b (501b pail) No Bid
8 Calcium Hypochlorite Tablets or Equivalent Anticipated Lead Time _ 7-10 days 1-2 weeks No Bid|
PN 59450 Calcium Hypochlorite|
Product Name 25IN45LBPA|  Chloromor Tabs (TMB 545W) No Bid
As Needed
(Pumped Off Truck) $1.2473/1b No Bid No Bid
9 Aqua Hawk 117 or Equivalent Anticipated Lead Time 7-10 days. No Bid No Bid|
PN 41836 Aqua Hawk 117
Product Name mini-bulk No Bid No Bid
As Needed
(Pumped Off Truck) $1.2613/1b) No Bid No Bid
10 Aqua Hawk 457 or Equivalent
qua Haw or Fquivaien Anticipated Lead Time 7-10 days No Bid| No Bid}
Product Name PN 41843 Aqua Hawk 457 No Bid No Bid
As Needed
(Pumped Off Truck) $1.2473/Ib $1.80/1b No Bid
11 TMB 901 or Equivalent Anticipated Lead Time 7-10 days 2-5 days No Bid
PN 41836 Aqua Hawk 117
Product Name mini-bulk TMB 901 No Bid
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