
Bid Title:
Bid Number:

Effective: 

Description

Item #

Section A 
Asphalt SurfaceTreatment 

GRAY Limestone Only
(FOB Bidders Site)

Product
Code/

Part Number

Bid Price
(Per Ton)

Product
Code/

Part Number

Bid Price
(Per Ton)

Product
Code/

Part Number

Bid Price
(Per Ton)

1 Size #8 No Bid No Bid 7022SLL 49.00

Item #

Section B
Surface Course Aggregate

(FOB Bidders Site)
. . .

2 #57 57B 46.80 48.20 7004R 47.00

3 Size #689 . No Bid . No Bid . No Bid

4 610 Limestone (White) 610B 41.05 41.86 . No Bid

5 #57 GRAY Limestone ONLY 57G 48.90 48.01 7004R 47.00

6 #67 GRAY Limestone ONLY No Bid No Bid 7008R 48.00

7 #610 GRAY Limestone ONLY 610G 45.30 41.86 7002B 44.00

Item #

Section C 
Surface Course Aggregate

(Delivered) (Limestone Only)
. . .

8 #57 - Zone 1 57B 55.85 59.31 No Bid

9 Size #689 - Zone 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid

10 610 Limestone (White) - Zone 1 610B 50.10 52.11 No Bid

11 #57 - Zone 2 57B 55.85 63.52 No Bid

12 Size #689 - Zone 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid

13 #610 Limestone (White) - Zone 2 610B 50.10 57.97 No Bid

14 #57 - Zone 3 57B 57.87 66.70 No Bid

15 Size #689 - Zone 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid

16 #610 Limestone (White) - Zone 3 610B 52.12 60.36 No Bid

Item #

Section D
Road Base Aggregate
 (FOB Bidders Site)                                 

. . .

17 Size #610 610G 45.30 41.86 7002B 44.00

Item #

Section E- Rip Rap 
(FOB Bidders Site) . .

18 Class 30 LB RR 70.05 56.85 7024C 66.00

19 Class 2 LB 1X4G 50.40 46.68 7016B 48.00

20 Class 10 LB RR 70.05 52.05 7024B 56.00

Item #

Section F- Flume Sand
(FOB Bidders Site) . . .

21 Flume Sand FS 21.20. No Bid 7005D 19.25

Item #

Section G- Flume Sand
(Delivered) . . .

22 Flume Sand-Zone 1 FS 29.25 No Bid No Bid

23 Flume Sand-Zone 2 FS 30.85 No Bid No Bid
24 Flume Sand-Zone 3 FS 31.69 No Bid No Bid

220 Westlatke Ave 220 Westlake Ave
Westlake, LA 70669

21185 S Frontage Rd 211855 S Frontage Rd
Iowa, LA 70647

210 Mike Hooks Rd
210 Mike Hooks Rd

No fuel surcharge will be added to bid items Flat fuel surcharge of all items .60/gallon (when fuel 
cost is greater than $3.00/gallon)

Flat fuel surcharge of all items N/A/gallon (when fuel 
cost is greater than $3.00/gallon)

Plant Location:

Dept Personnel: Div of Engineering & Public Works

Dispatch
337-436-1846

westlakeyard@portaggregates.com

Thomas Gaskin
337-239-6353

thomasg@apeckconstruction.com                       
Tim Royer 337 208 5914

Ron Weichmann
337-433-3900 ext 210

rweichmann@dunhamprice.com

337-824-7777 (f) 337-378-0372 (f) 337485-9165 (f)

SB-2025-PW-132

July 1, 2025 until December 31, 2025

Steven Emerson
337-824-7625

semerson@portaggregates.com

Tryon Williams
337-239-6353

williamst@apeckconstruction.com

Richard V Sprigg
337-433-3900

rsprigg@dunhamprice.com

Vendor Vendor Vendor

Crushed Stone
Port Aggregates, Inc. Apeck Aggregate Supply LLC DP Aggregates LLC


	SB-2025-PW-132 final

