Bid Title

Concrete Pipe

Vendor

Bid Number

SB-2022-PW-168

Design Precast & Pipe Inc.

Effective Period

July 1, 2025 until December 31, 2025 contract extended

Chris A Fore

Dept Personnel

Division of Engineering & Public Works

228-831-5833 228-831-2791 (f)

tforbes@designprecast.com

Item# Description 10% Pref m
Reinforced Concrete Pipe (RCP) - Round Eight (8) foot joints
BID PRICE Item 1-10
Size PER JOINT (4G, Modified, or Equal)
1 15" 179.20 Modified
2 18" 245.76 Modified
3 24" 376.32 Modified
4 30" 542.72 Modified
5 36" 704.00 Modified
6 42" 878.08 Modified
7 48" 1,111.04 T/G
8 54" 1,367.04 T/G
9 60" 1,658.88 T/G
10 72" 2,319.36 T/G
Reinforced Concrete Pipe (RCP) - Round with Gasket
BID PRICE Item 11-20
Size PER JOINT (4G, Modified, or Equal)
11 15" 179.20 Modified
12 18" 245.76 Modified
13 24" 376.32 Modified
14 30" 542.72 Modified
15 36" 704.00 Modified
16 42" 878.08 Modified
17 48" 1,111.04 T/G
18 54" 1,367.04 T/G
19 60" 1,658.88 T/G
20 72" 2,319.36 T/G
Arched Reinforced Concrete Pipe (ARCP)
BID PRICE Specify Pipe Design (T/G,
Size PER JOINT 4G, Motified, or Equal)
21 18"x11" (15" Equiv.) 255.68 T/G
22 22"x13" (18" Equiv.) 318.24 T/G
23 28"x18" (24" Equiv.) 443.36 T/G
24 36"x22" (30" Equiv.) 533.12 T/G
25 43"x26" (36" Equiv.) 731.68 T/G
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26 51"x31" (42" Equiv.) 946.56 T/G
27 58'"x36" (48" Equiv.) 1,204.96 T/G
28 40"x65" (54" Equiv.) 1,468.80 T/G
29 45" x73" (60" Equiv.) 1,814.24 T/G
30 54"x88" (72" Equiv.) 2,524.16 T/G
Arched Reinforced Concrete Pipe (ARCP) with Gasket
BID PRICE Specify Pipe Design (T/G,

Size PER JOINT 4G, Modified, or Equal)
31 18"x11" (15" Equiv.) NO BID NO BID
32 22"x13" (18" Equiv.) NO BID NO BID
33 28"x18" (24" Equiv.) NO BID NO BID
34 36"x22" (30" Equiv.) NO BID NO BID
35 43"x26" (36" Equiv.) NO BID NO BID
36 51"x31" (42" Equiv.) NO BID NO BID
37 58"x36" (48" Equiv.) NO BID NO BID
38 40"x65" (54" Equiv.) NO BID NO BID
39 45"x73" (60" Equiv.) NO BID NO BID
40 54"x88" (72" Equiv.) NO BID NO BID

Ramneck Cost Per Box

Size Price Strips per Box
41 1" NO BID NO BID
42 1-1/4" NO BID NO BID
43 1-1/2" NO BID NO BID
a4 1-3/4" NO BID NO BID
45 2" NO BID NO BID

Cost per Pallet

Size Price Boxes Per Pallet
46 1" NO BID NO BID
47 1-1/4" NO BID NO BID
48 1-1/2" NO BID NO BID
49 1-3/4" NO BID NO BID
50 2" NO BID NO BID
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