Bid Name: Uniforms Purchase Southern Specialty Products LLC Cintas Corporation
3374749090 office
Bid Number. SB-2025-CPPJ-102 i 337-7944392
Personnel: CPPJ Departments Charle McAdon Corey Hale
Effectve: March 7, 2025 until November 30,2025 char hale2@cintas.com
Non-responsive
Product Material and Product Material and
Item # Description Size Part Number Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price
Additional fe for “tall” $3.00 NoBid
A Fee for “Tall” size. Fee applics to all shirts in this bid. regardless of shirt size - *
Embroidery. Fee applies to all garments in this bid. Embroidery up to 5,000 $6.00 No Bid
B | ALL PARISH DEPARTMENTS ARE TO ONLY HAVE SINGLE COLOR EMBROIDERY stitches - **
Embroidery. Fee applies to all garments in this bid. Embroidery up to 10,000 $10.00 No Bid
C | ALL PARISH DEPARTMENTS ARE TO ONLY HAVE SINGLE COLOR EMBROIDERY stitches - **
Sewing on Patches of $5.00 No Bid
D Sewing on Patches. Fee applics to sewing on Parish Patches to all garments on this bid various sizes
Additional fee for cach
added screen print color that
Additional screen print color for Tee-shirts that include screen printing. is in addition to the number $1.25 No Bid
Ex: If a shirt has a two color screen print, what is the additional cost to make it a three color of colors stated in the bid
E screen print. item
Button Up Shirts i sinsare o includea single-color embroidery of up to 5,000 stitches in the bid price.
Men’s Button Up Shirt S/S Size S XL $35.80 No Bid
Size 2XL - 3XL $38.80 No Bid
/35 Poly/cott I
1 BG72168 BG-72168 65/35 Poly/cotton poplin
Shirt should be available in the sleeve length specificd above and have a pocket located on the left chest (Men only for blend 4/5 $41
pocket). Shirts should be constructed of wrinkle-resistant 65/35 poly/cotton fabric and have adjustable cufs 67843
Size 4XL and above No Bid
8/9 845
10 $48
Men’s Button Up Shirt L/S Size S — XL $35.80 No Bid
Size 2XL - 3XL é’lsf 3d5 l?"’}lj/“’“‘;“‘ ;";Pl'“_ $38.80 No Bid
2 BG-7216 BG-7216 enc IBAtweIgnt > 028
Shirts should be available in the sleeve length specified above and have a pocket located on the left chest (Men only for button down collar and bone 4/5 541
pocket). Shirts should be constructed of wrinkle-resistant 65/35 poly/cotton fabric and have adjustable cufs buttons PR
Size 4XL and above No Bid
8/9 845
10 $48
Women's Shirt S/S Size XS - XL $35.80 No Bid
Size IXW — 3XW 65735 poly/caotion poplin $38.80 No Bid
) ) lend lightweight 8 o
3 BG-62168 BG-6216S blend lightweight 3.5 ozs
Shirt should be available in the sleeve length specified above and have a pocket located on the left chest (Men only for bone buttons with spread 4/5 41
pocke). Shirts should be constructed of wrinkle-resistant 65/35 poly/cotton fabric and have adjustable cuff, collar b
Size 4XW and above No Bid
8/9 845
10 $48
Women's Shirt L/S Size XS - XL $35.80 No Bid
Size IXW - 3XW 65/35 poly/cotton poplin $38.80 No Bid
4 BG-6216 BG-6216 blend lightweight 5.5 ozs
Shirts should be available in the sleeve length specified above and have a pocket located on the left chest (Men only for bone buttons with spread 4/5 541
pocket). Shirts should be constructed of wrinkle-resistant 65/35 poly/cotton fabric and have adjustable cufs collar PR
Size 4XW and above No Bid
8/9 845
10 $49
Women's 3/4 Sleeve Blouse Size XS - XL $36.00 No Bid
65/35 p poplin
blend lightweight 5.5 ozs
5 Size IXW - 3XW BG-6260 BG-6260 ﬁ"“ ) 'gd b‘ff ot v"z’ $39.00 No Bid
Shirt should be available in the sleeve length specificd above and have a pocket located on the Ieft chest (Men only for ont and back darts an
pocket). Shirts should be constructed of wrinkle-resistant 65/35 poly/cotton fabric and have adjustable cufs spread collar
Size 4XW and above $41.00 No Bid
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Bid Name: Uniforms Purchase Southern Specialty Products LLC Cintas Corporation
337474-9090 office
Bid Number SB-2025-CPPJ-102 ey 337-794-4392
Personnet CPPJ Departments Charle McAdon Corey Hale
Effective March 7, 2025 until November 30, 2025 char com hale2@cintas.com
Non-responsive
Product Material and Product Material and
Item # Description Size Part Number Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price
Men’s S/S Shirt Size S - XL $33.75 No Bid
55% cotton 45% polyester
6 Material will be 65/35 poly/cotton and will be wrinkle resistant and have button-down collars. Shirts will be available in Size 2XL - 3XL 374 M5008 twill 4.50z stain release $36.75 No Bid
long and/or short sleeve. Color choices should include white, light blue, burgundy/white, blue/white, and French blue. fabric button down collar
Neck sizes may vary between 157~ 187 Size 4XL and above $38.75 No Bid
Women’s S/S Shirt Size 2-24 $33.74 No Bid
55% cotton 45% polyester
. ). M W twill 4.50z stain release .
7 Material will be 65/35 poly/cotton and will be wrinkle resistant and have button-down collars. Shirts will be available in Extended Sizes 66528 5008 fabric front and back darts No Bid
long andlor short sleeve. Colorchoices should include white, light blue, burgundy/white, buewhite, and French bue. and spread collar $36.75
Neck sizes may vary between 15” — 18", .
No Bid
Men’s L/ S Shirt Size S— XL $31.50 No Bid
55% cotton 45% polyester
. 374 M twill 4.50z stain release .
8 Material will be 65/35 poly/cotton and will be wrinkle resistant and have button-down collars. Shirts will be available in Size 2XL - 3XL 37 500 button adjustable cuffs and $34.00 No Bid
long and/or short sleeve. Color choiwsN shc;nk‘i include »’vhi!(l:’, 1:"%111 bl;.g;liu.l»i\indy/wmc, blue/white, and French blue. button down collar
cksizes may vary between 157 17 Size 4XL and sbove $36.00 NoBid
Women’s S/S Shirt Size 2-24 $31.50 No Bid
55% cotton 45% polyester
. twill 4.50z stain release .
9 Material will be 65/35 poly/cotton and will be wrinkle resistant and have button-down collars. Shirts will be available in Extended Sizes 66528 Ms00W button adjustable cuffs and No Bid
long and/or short sleeve. Color choices should include white, light blue, burgundy/white, bluc/white, and French blue. spread collar $34.00
Neck sizes may vary between 15" — 18", P .
No Bid
Men’s S/S Shirt Size S - XL $37.45 No Bid
100% polyester ripstop
100% polyester mesh in
10 Size 2XL - 3XL M580 M580 o POy e $40.45 No Bid
Shirts should be 100% Polyester ripstop with 100% polyester mesh in upper back. Full Button Closure, upper back 3.390z structured
structured collar, and back vent system for added breathability. collar full button closure
Size 4XL and above $42.45 No Bid
Women’s S/ S Shirt Size S - XL 100% polyester ripston $37.45 No Bid
100% polyester mesh in
11 Size 2XL - 3XL M580W MS580W uppper back 3.390z full $40.95 No Bid
Shirts should be 100% Polyester ripstop with 100% polyester mesh in upper back. Full Button Closure, button closure
structured collar, and back vent system for added breathability. collar
Size 4XL and above $42.95 No Bid
Long Sleeve Men’s Shirt Size S— XL $60.40 No Bid
12 Size 2XL - 3XL 72175 72175 4.20z 65% poly 35% cotton $60.40 No Bid
Shirts will be equal to, or exceed the specifications of the Men's Tactical Pro available in long slceve and short sleeve as
specified. Color choices will include dark navy and black
Size 4XL and above $60.40 No Bid
Short Sleeve Men’s Shirt Size S - XL $55.30 No Bid
13 Size 2XL - 3XL 71175 71175 4.20z 65% poly 35% cotton $55.30 No Bid
Shirts will be equal to, or exceed the specifications of the Men's Tactical Pro available in long slceve and short slceve as
specified. Color choices will include dark navy and black
Size 4XL and above $55.30 No Bid
Long Sleeve Women’s Shirt Size S— XL $60.40 No Bid
14 Size 2XL - 3XL 62070 62070 4.20z 65% poly 35% cotton $60.40 No Bid
Shirts will be equal to, or exceed the specifications of the Men's Tactical Pro available in long slceve and short sleeve as
specified. Color choices will include dark navy and black
Size 4XL and above $60.40 No Bid
. Size S - XL $35.74 No Bid
Short Sleeve Shirt
15 | ropper BDU short sleeve button down shirt made of 100% polyester. Two patches which must be sewn, one on each sleeve, Size 2XL - 3XL F5301-38 F5301-38 4.202 65% poly 35% cotton $35.74 No Bid
will be provided by the Parish. Shirts should be considered snag-proof or snag-resistant. Color choice will be Dark Grey.
Bid price will be inclusive of required sewing. Size 4XL and above EG7 NoBid
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Southern Specialty Products LLC

Cintas Corporation

Bid Name: Uniforms Purchase
337-474-9090 office
Bid Number: SB-2025-CPPJ-102 $37-438.3579 cell 337-794-4392
Personnel: CPPJ Departments Charle McAdon Corey Hale
Effective: March 7, 2025 until November 30, 2025 char hale2@cintas.com
Non-responsive
Product Material and Product Material and
Item # Description Size Part Number Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price
Women’s Comfort Blouse Size S - XL No Bid No Bid
16 Size 2XL - 3XL 205 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Shirts will be equal to, or exceed the specifications of Cintas Part # 205. Contouring fit with a shaped hem line. 65/35
poly/cotton blend. Long sizes should be available.
Size 4XL and above No Bid No Bid
X Size S— XL $36.58 No Bid
Women’s Long Sleeve
95% poly 5% spandex 4.30z
17 Size 2XL - 3XL 66273 MM2013 double patch pockets camp $39.58 No Bid
Shirts will be equal to, or exceed the specifications of Cintas Part # 66273, Wrinkle free with a slightly curved hem line. style collar
65/35 poly/cotton blend.
Size 4XL and above $42.58 No Bid
Polo Shirts au snis are o include single-color embroidery of up to 5,000 stitches in the bid price.
Men's Polo Shirt Size S - XL $48.50 No Bid
Shirts will be equal to, or exceed, the specifications of the 5.11 Tactical Jersey Polo, available as short sleeve, or long sleeve.| Size 2XL - 3XL . . $48.50 No Bid
18 | Shirts will come with the following features: 6 oz 100% jersey knit cotton; professional appearance, durable 71182 71182 60z 100% jersey knit cotton
traditional three-button placket; no roll, stay flat collar; pen pockets on left sleeve; integrated mic loops at the shoulders and
chest; fude, srink, and wrinkle resistant fabrics Melaimine buttons won'tburn, crack, or melt bartacking at major strss Size 4XL and above $48.50 No Bid
points; and accepts embroidery and silk screening.
Women’s Cornerstone Polo Shirt Size S — XL $34.88 No Bid
100% snag proof polyester
Size 2XL 6.50z mic clips at center $36.88 No Bid
19 CS411 CS411 placket and shoulders side
Tactical Polos with mic clips at center placket and shoulders. Material should be 6.6 oz. 100% snag proof polyester, or i vents reinforced dual pen i
cqual, and moisurc-wicking. Size 3XL " $38.88 No Bid
pockets on left sleeve
Size 4XL $40.88 No Bid
Men’s Cornerstone S/S Shirt Size XS — XL No Bid
$34.88
100% polyester 6.50z mic
Size 2XL - 3XL clips at center placket and $38.88 No Bid
CS410 y h
20 TLC410/LT-4XLT Cs410 shoulders side vents
Tactical Polos with mic clips at center placket and shoulders. Material should be 6.6 0z. 100% snag proof polyester, or . ) /LT~ reinforced dual pen pockets .
equal, and moisture-wicking. Size 4XL and above A SllimP $40.88 No Bid
Size 4XL and above .
37. No Bi
TALLS $37.88 0 Bid
Men’s Cotton Polo Size S - XL $26.68 No Bid
Size 2XL - 3XL 100% cotton 6.207 si $30.88 No Bid
21 K800 K8000 00% cof ,0"6 oz side
Should be made of EZCotton Pique, 6.5 0z., 100% cotton; gently contoured silhouette; piping detail inside neckband; button| vents
placket; and side vents.
Size 4XL and above $33.00 No Bid
Women’s Cotton Polo Size S - XL $26.38 No Bid
Size 2XL - 3XL 100% cotte 20z sii $30.88 No Bid
2 1800 LK8000 00% cof ,0" 6.20z side
Should be made of EZCotton Pique, 6.5 0z., 100% cotton; gently contoured silhouette; piping detail inside neckband; button| vents
placket; and side vents.
Size 4XL and above $32.88 No Bid
Men’s Short Sleeve Polo w/ Pocket Size S - XL $21.28 No Bid
40z 100% polyester double
23 ) . . Size 2XL - 3XL Ks40P K540P knit 3 button placket & left $24.88 No Bid
‘Work shirt should be 100% polyester with three (3) button placket and a left chest pocket. Shirt chest pocket
should be snag resistant and tag free. . i
Size 4XL and above $26.88 No Bid
Adidas Polo Shirt for Men Size S — XL $42.50 No Bid
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Bid Name: Uniforms Purchase Southern Specialty Products LLC Cintas Corporation
3374749090 office
Bid Number SB-2025-CPPJ-102 ey 337-794-4392
Personnet CPPJ Departments Charle McAdon Corey Hale
Effective March 7, 2025 until November 30,2025 char com hale2@cintas.com
Non-responsive
Product Material and Product Material and
Item # Description Size Part Number Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price
TOU7% TCCYCIea poTyestel
24 Size 2XL - 3XL A230 A230 3.80z UPF 50+ protection 3 $44.50 No Bid
Equal to the Adidas brand ClimaL ite shirt, featuring a rib-knit collar with 3 button placket, UPF 50+ protection, 3-stripes on| button placket
back-neck collar, open-hem sleeves and made of 100% polyester fabric and contrast color heat ransfer logo on right sleeve.
Size 4XL and above $46.50 No Bid
Adidas Polo Shirt for Women Size S— XL $42.54 No Bid
100% recycled polyester
25 Size 2XL - 3XL A231 A231 3.807 3 button placket UPF $44.50 No Bid
Equal to the Adidas brand ClimaLite shirt, featuring a rib-knit collar with 3 button placket, UPF 50+ protection, 3-stripes on| 50+
back-neek collar, open-hem sleeves and made of 100% polyester fabric and contrast color heat rransfer logo on right sleeve, P
Size 4XL and above No Bid No Bid
Women’s Short Sleeve Polo Size S— XL $25.00 No Bid
100% polyester 4.10z open
26 Size 2XL — 3XL L528 L528 "Pl yest P $28.00 No Bid
hem sleeves
Woren's short sleeve 100% polyester jacquard polo. Light weight and breathable polo with an open placket.
Size 4XL and above $30.00 No Bid
Men’s Moisture-Wicking Sport Polo Size S - XL $25.50 No Bid
Sire XL XL 3.80z 100% polyester tricot 2850 NoBid
ize 2XL -3 R ! 0 Bi
27 |Shirts shouldbe  double mesh Sport Style Shirt, with super venfilation and moisturc-wicking. Shirts be'3'5 0z, M353 ST650 double needle stitch
of 100% polyester double mesh, or equal, and the sleeves and bottom hem should be double needle stitched. The Women's throughout 1 $30.50
Polo should have a feminine V-slt collar and the Men's Polo should have a three-button placke. Size 4XL and above SR No Bid
6x1 $33.50
Men’s Propper Ice Polo S/S Size S - XL $44.24 No Bid
5 y 6.80z 94% polyester 6%
28 Size 2XL - 3XL F5341 F5341 PR 4424 No Bid
Shirts should be Fade- shrink-, and wrinkle-resistant moisture-wicking fabric. Shirts should have hidden collar buttons, mic spandex interloc
clip on shoulders, pen pocket, and extended length for tucking in
Size 4XL and above 44.24 No Bid
Men’s Propper Ice Polo L/S Size S - XL $52.74 No Bid
5 y 6.80z 94% polyester 6%
29 Size 2XL - 3XL Fs315 F5315 PR 52.74 No Bid
Shirts should be Fade- shrink-, and wrinkle-resistant moisture-wicking fabric. Shirts should have hidden collar buttons, mic spandex interloc
clip on shoulders, pen pocket, and extended length for tucking in.
Size 4XL and above 52.74 No Bid
Women's Propper Ice Polo /S Size S - XL $44.24 No Bid
5 y 6.80z 94% polyester 6%
30 Size 2XL - 3XL F5327 F5327 PR 4424 No Bid
Shirts should be Fade- shrink-, and wrinkle-resistant moisture-wicking fabric. Shirts should have hidden collar buttons, mic spandex interloc
clip on shoulders, pen pocket, and extended length for tucking in
Size 4XL and above 44.24 No Bid
Women’s Propper Ice Polo L/S Size S - XL $52.74 No Bid
5 y 6.80z 94% polyester 6%
31 Size 2XL - 3XL F5357 F5357 PR 52.74 No Bid
Shirts should be Fade- shrink-, and wrinkle-resistant moisture-wicking fabric. Shirts should have hidden collar buttons, mic spandex interloc
clip on shoulders, pen pocket, and extended length for tucking in
Size 4XL and above 52.74 No Bid
Men’s Cotton Touch Polo Size S - XL $26.38 No Bid
5.80z 95/5 poly/spandex
3 Size 2XL - 3XL K568 K568 POLSP $29.68 No Bid
Cotton-touch performance polo. Shirts should be 5.8 oz, 95/5 poly/spandex jersey, or equal, with a self-fabric collar, tag- Jersey
free.
Size 4XL and above $31.38 No Bid
Women'’s Cotton Touch Polo Size S - XL $26.38 No Bid
5.80z 95/5 poly/spandex
33 N X X X Size 2XL - 3XL Ls68 L568 povisp $29.68 No Bid
Cotton-touch performance polo. Shirts should be 5.8 oz, 95/5 poly/spandex jersey, or equal, with a self-fabric collar, tag- Jersey
free.
Size 4XL and above $31.38 No Bid
Men’s 5.11 Helio Polo Size S - XL $45.10 No Bid

Page 4 of 19



mailto:charles@southernspecialtyproducts.com
mailto:charles@southernspecialtyproducts.com
mailto:hale2@cintas.com
mailto:hale2@cintas.com
mailto:charles@southernspecialtyproducts.com
mailto:hale2@cintas.com

Bid Name: Uniforms Purchase Southern Specialty Products LLC Cintas Corporation
. 337-474-9090 office
Bid Number: SB-2025-CPPJ-102 $37-438.3579 cell 337-794-4392
Personnel: CPPJ Departments Charle McAdon Corey Hale
Effective: March 7, 2025 until November 30, 2025 char com hale2@cintas.com
Non-responsive
Product Material and Product Material and
Item # Description Size Part Number Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price
. 100% polyester jersey 4.50z .
34 Size 2XL - 3XL 41192 41192 00% polyester jersey 4.50 $45.10 No Bid
Short Sleeve Polo made of a snag-resistant jersey knit fabric with moisture-wicking and odor control capabilities. Includes a wicking & anti-color
pen pocket, front mic loop, and shoulder mic pocket
Size 4XL and above $45.10 No Bid
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Bid Name: Uniforms Purchase Southern Specialty Products LLC Cintas Corporation
337-474-9090 office
2025-CPPJ- 337-794-4392
Bid Number $B-2025-CPPJ-102 pliny by 3 39
Personnel: CPPJ Departments Charle McAdon Corey Hale
Effective: March 7, 2025 until November 30, 2025 char com hale2@cintas.com
Non-responsive
Product Material and Product Material and
Item # Description Size Part Number Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price
King Size, Longer Length Polos Size XL $21.25 No Bid
35 Size 2XL - 3XL NA K500/K500ES 50z 65/35 poly/cotton pique $24.25 No Bid
This polo shirt should be available in larger sizes up to 7XL. The polo shirt is to be longer than standard polo shirts
(approximately 3" longer) and available in a big and tall length. Made of 100% pre-shrunk combed cotton, or equal, so that
it does not shrink in the dryer. Size 4XL $26.25 No Bid
Men’s Moisture-Wicking Sport Polo Size S - XL $21.25 No Bid
Size 2XL - 3XL $24.25 No Bid
36 Shirts should be designed to keep the employee dry during the hot summer months, resist fading and shrinkage and be 67306 ST405/TLK510 75} 1312 rayon
antimicrobial. Shirts should come with a three-button placket, b d 0f 67/33 cotton/poly, or equal, and the cuffs Size 4XL and above TLKS10/LT-4XLT Jersey 3-button placket 4x1526.25 No Bid
and collar should be 100% polyester to retain their shape. No less than six (6) color choices should be available. Shirts 5/6x1 $28.25
should be wrinkle-fre or wrinkle-resistant.
Size 4XL and above TALL $34.00 No Bid
Women’s Moisture-Wicking Sport Polo Size XS - XL $21.28 No Bid
Size 2XL — 3XL $24.28 No Bid
) ) o ) " 75/13/12 poly/cotton/rayon
37 Shirts should be designed to keep the employee dry during the hot summer months, resist fading and shrinkage and be 67277 LST405 !
antimicrobial. Shirts should come with a three-button placket, b d of 67/33 cotton/poly, or equal, and the cuffs jersey 3-button placket
and collar should be 100% polyester to retain their shape. No less than six (6) color choices should be available. Shirts
should be wrinkle-fre or wrinkle-resistant. ize 4XL and above :
Size 4XL and above $26.28 No Bid
Men’s 5.1 Short Slecve Polo Size XS - XL $46.80 No Bid
‘Shirt will be equal to or exceed the specificationsof the 5.11 Performance Polo style lsted above. Shirt il be 6.7 o Size 2XL - 3XL 100% polyester snag and $46.80 No Bid
38 jersey kit polyester, fully gusseted sleeves, traditional 3-button placket, and have Melamine buttons that will not burn, 71049 71049 nkle revist A
crack, or melt. Bartacking at major stress points and accepts embroidery and silk screening. Snap, rip, and wrinkle resistant| wrinkle resistant moisture
Smart weave fabric, moisture wicking, wicking, quick drying, and anti-microbial material are required. No-roll collar with wicking melamine buttons
flexible collar stays, dual pen pockets at left sleeve, integrated microphone loops at the left shoulders and chest. Embroidery A et :
will be on the left chest, gold color “Calcasieu Parish” arched with CERT under it, straight. Part #5 71049 and #72049 Size 4XL and above $46.80 No Bid
should also be available in tall sizes to include the color choices of Black, Silver Tan, and Navy.
Men’s 5.11 Long Sleeve Polo Size XS - XL $50.26 No Bid
Shirt will be equal to or exceed the specifications of the 5.11 Performance Polo style listed above. Shirt will be 6.7 oz. Size 2XL - 3XL 100% polyester jersey knit $50.26 NoBid
3 jersey kit polyester, fully gusseted sleeves, traditional 3-bution placket, and have Melamine buttons that will not burn, 2049 204 6.80z wicking & anti-odor
39 crack, or melt. Bartacking at major stress points and accepts embroidery and silk screcning. Snap, rip, and wrinkle resistant 720: 72049 finish snag rip and wrinkle
Smart weave fabric, moisture wicking, wicking, quick drying, and anti-microbial material are required. No-roll collar with resistant
flexible collar stays,dual pen pockets at et sleve, ntegrated mictophone loops atthe lef shoulders and chest. Embroidery| . yvy oo $5026 NoBid
will be on the left chest, gold color “Calcasieu Parish” arched with CERT under it, straight. Part #s 71049 and #72049 © and above g °
should also be available in tall sizes to include the color choices of Black, Silver Tan, and Navy.
Women's 3/4 Sleeve Polo Shirt Size XS - XL $25.06 No Bid
65% polyester 35% cotton
. 50z 4 button placket metal .
40" | Women’s EZCotton Pique, 3/4 sleeve. 6.5 oz, 100% cotton; gently contoured silhouete; piping detail inside neckband; 4- Size 2XL - 3XL L562 L562 butions with dyed to match $28.06 No Bid
bution placket; and side vents Ehin wi_lLl‘ l:avc chml?ruideryﬁ:;r;) a:z frur;\l/[ lclﬁ_ c}w:l lLughu design and thrad colo choices il plastic rims side vents
e provided to the successful bidder. Multiple color choices. Size 4XL and above $30.06 No Bid
Women's Short Sleeve, Safety Shirt Size XS - XL $26.38 No Bid
5.70z short-sleeve pique
41 Women’s short-sleeve pique polo shirt with UPE 30 rating, two-button placket, rib-knit collar and cuffs, straight bottorn, Size 2XL - 3XL BGes10 BG66510 polo ’h‘n“ with UPF 30 $29.38 No Bid
reinforced side vents, curl-free collar, and taped neck and shoulders. Shirt will have embroidery on the front left chest. L 100% polyester
design and thread color choices will be provided to the successful bidder. Available in Optic Yellow Size 4XL and above $31.38 No Bid
Jacket Size S - XL $104.50 No Bid
00% nylon shell with water|
Size 2XL resistant 100% polyester S50 No Bid

sherpa fleece lining 6.80z
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Bid Name: Uniforms Purchase Southern Specialty Products LLC Cintas Corporation
337-474-9090 office
Bid Number: SB-2025-CPPJ-102 137-438.3579 cell 337-794-4392
Personnel: CPPJ Departments Charle McAdon Corey Hale
Effective: March 7, 2025 until November 30, 2025 char hale2@cintas.com
Non-responsive
Product Material and Product Material and
Item # Description Size Part Number Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price
- Jacket is to be waterproof; seam sealed and made of 100% ripstop nylon shell with Taslan nylon accents, or equal. Jacket v Vs zip off hood fully seam
should have a zip-off hood and zippered pockets. Polycslerlﬁberﬁll for insulation and warmth; and available in multiple Size 3XL sealed for water proof $108.50 No Bid
colors
Size 4XL and above $110.50 No Bid
Coach's Jacket Size S - XL $30.14 No Bid
water resistant outer shell of
43 Size 2XL - 3XL 3430 3100 100% nylon taffeta lined $32.14 No Bid
Unisex coach's jacket, 100% 2.08 oz. polyester shell with brushed tricot lining repels light rain. Open side pockets and with 100% polyester
elastic cuffs. Open hem with adjustable drawstring. Should come in multiple colors including Navy.
Size 4XL and above $36.00 No Bid
Men’s Saga Jacket Size S~ XL 100% polyester shell 4.1oz $65.48 No Bid
100% polyester fleece body
44 Size 2XL - 3XL 8880 J331 lining 100% polyester-lined $68.48 No Bid
Three Season jacket constructed of windproofiwater resistant polyester reversed dobby and is lined with 7.8 oz anti-pilling sleeves with 20z polyfill
micro fleece. Includes two front zip pockets, inner chest zip pocket, and adjustable Velcro cuffs. insulation
Size 4XL and above " $70.48 No Bid
Women’s Sequel Jacket Size S~ XL 100% polyester shell 4.1oz $65.48 No Bid
100% polyester fleece body
45 Size 2XL - 3XL 8860 L331 lining 100% polyester-lined $68.48 No Bid
Three Season jacket constructed of windproofiwater resistant polyester reversed dobby and is lined with 7.8 oz anti-pilling sleeves with 20z polyfill
micro fleece. Includes two front zip pockets, inner chest zip pocket, and adjustable Velero cuffs. insulation
Size 4XL and above - $70.48 No Bid
Safety High-Visibility Bomber Jacket Size S— XL $69.75 No Bid
Size 2XL $69.75 No Bid
4.70z/yd (300 denier) 100%
. 8 5 P i polyester durable waterproof] .
46 Jacket will be equal to or exceed the speclﬁcallon§ oflhg ERB Pt. # 5106 Safefy»Hl-Vl}slblluy Size 3XL 5106 18121 led shell with S No Bid
Bomhe.r Jacket. ANSI Class II, Polyester 300D f)xtord with PU t;oallyng, fleece lining, zipper and Size 4XL thermal insulation 2" wide $69.75 No Bid
snap front closure. Detachable hood, two exterior pockets, one interior pgckel and conforms to reflective material .
ANSI/ISEA 107 for design, color and reflectivity. Color will be lime over black . .
Size SXL $69.75 No Bid
Size 6XL 6x1 No Bid No Bid
Size S — XL $74.10 No Bid
Tactical Jacket
47 Jacket will be equal to, or exceed, the specifications of the 5.11 Tactical brand part #48016-724. Size 2XL - 3XL 48016-724 48016-724 High performance micro- $74.10 No Bid
Color will be Dark Navy (Pt. # 724) and will contain the following features: Superior ility, all- fiber all weather comfort
weather comfort; Hidden document pockets at the chest; Zippered handwarmer pockets; Hidden ID
panels at chest and back; and Elasticized hem and cuffs to keep out rain and cold. Size 4XL and above $74.10 No Bid
Men’s Three Season Jacket Size S — XL $77.38 No Bid
100% taslan nylon shell
P Size 2XL - 3XL 00 304 4.70z 100% microflecce $79.38 No Bid
Jacket should be constructed of a 100% taslon nylon shell with microfleece lining and lightweight polyfill insulation. D7 I body lining 100% polyester
Outside zip pockets and inside zip security pockets. Should have multiple color options and must come available in Red and sleeve lining
Rt Size 4XL and above $81.38 No Bid
Women’s Three Season Jacket Size S — XL $77.38 No Bid
100% taslan nylon shell
. , 4.70z 100% microfleece .
49 Jacket should be constructed of a 100% taslon nylon shell with microfleece lining and lightweight polyfill insulation. Size 2XL - 3XL D700W L304 body lining 100% polyester $79.38 No Bid
Outside zip pockets and inside zip security pockets. Should have multiple color options and must come available in Red and sleeve lining
Rt Size 4XL and above $81.38 No Bid
High-Visibility Bomber Jacket Size S — XL 5702 /yd 100% polyester $103.50 No Bid
ripstop durable material with|
Size 2XL waterproof seam-sealed $103.50 No Bid
7302/yd fl
Size 3XL lined body & hood/Hood fits $103.50 No Bid

into the collar or can be
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Bid Name: Uniforms Purchase Southern Specialty Products LLC Cintas Corporation
337-474-9090 office
Bid Number: SB-2025-CPPJ-102 iy e 337-794-4392
Prsonnel: CPPJ Departments Charle McAdon Corey Hale
Effective: March 7, 2025 until November 30, 2025 char com hale2@cintas.com
Non-responsive
Product Material and Product Material and
Item # Description Size Part Number Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price
50 | Jackests should be equal to Cintas Pt #60862, ANSI Class 3 jacket. Should have a fleece lining and roll away hood to keep Size XL 60862 Is130 removed altogether Quilted SR No Bid
warm, a waterproof coating and sealed sems to stay dry. Jacket should have four pakeets including radio pocket on right sleeves for easy arm in and i
chest and 2" reflective material on 100% polyester. Color choice should be lime yellow. out access 2" wide high-
Size SXL performance reflective $103.50 No Bid
material adjustable cuffs
with rubber pulls for casy
Size 6XL use when wearing glove 6x1 No Bid No Bid
‘Waterproof Jacket Size S - XL $47.63 No Bid
100% polyester with
. waterproof face coating .
51 Size 2XL - 3XL 80189 ISTS6 waterprool face coating $50.63 No Bid
Jacket will be waterproof: seam sealed and made of 100% Taslan nylon, or equal. Polyester fiberfill for warmth; and Fully scam-sealed jersey-
available in colors 3 or lined body and hood
Size 4XL and above $52.63 No Bid
Water Repellent Jacket Size XS — XL $125.00 No Bid
Size 2XL 100% polyester shell 100% $127.00 No Bid
5 0182 1310 polyester lining 100%
Jacket will be water repellent stretch polyester shell; 16 oz. microfleece interior for warmth; and available in color choices Size 3XL polyester microfleece inner $129.00 No Bid
navy/charcoal and/or black/charcoal jacket
Size 4XL $131.00 No Bid
Jacket ~XL . 1. No Bi
ackel Size S 00% polyester shell with S o Bid
DWR finish 100% polyester
Size 2XL - 3XL lining weatherproof outer $95.00 No Bid
53 80175 1920 layer into which other
Jacket will be a 228 Taslan nylon fabric and include a heavy-duty zipper with a ripstop nylon storm-flap placket, concealed collective styles can be
zip-off hood. and side entry lower chest pockets with zipper closures. Elastic cuffs. Available in two-tone or solid colors. zipped and secured by sna
Size 4XL and above PP ¥ snap $98.00 No Bid
attachments
Size S — XL No Bid No Bid
Horace Small brand jacket
54 Jacket price to include Orange/Silver Reflective 1 %4” tape on horizontal upper back and horizontal under pocket. Jacket Size 2XL - 3XL HS3352 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
color will be black. Jacket will have an American Flag patch sewn on the right sleeve and an Animal Services patch sewn
on the left sleeve. The patches will be provided by the Parish to the awarded Vendor. Bid price will be inclusive of the
required sewing. Size 4XL and above No Bid No Bid
Sport-Tek, Ladies Fleece Full Zip Size XS - XL $41.68 No Bid
Size 2XL $43.68 No Bid
402 70/2:
55 LSTS560 LST560 740z 70/25/5
. , o Size 3XL poly/rayon/spandex $45.68 No Bid
‘This jacket should be light weight with stretch, this fleece has a cotton hand and wicks moisture.
Size 4XL $47.68 No Bid
Sport-Tek, Ladies Fleece 1/4 Zip Size XS - XL $36.58 No Bid
Size 2XL $38.58 No Bid
7.40z 70/25/5
56 . LST561 LST561 .
Size 3XL poly/rayon/spandex $40.58 No Bid
This jacket should be light weight with stretch, this fleece has a cotton hand and wicks moisture,
Size 4XL $42.58 No Bid
Sport-Tek, Men's Fleece Full Zip Size XS - XL $41.68 No Bid
Size 2XL $43.68 No Bid
402 70/2:
57 ST560 ST560 7-doz 70/25/5
. , o Size 3XL poly/rayon/spandex $45.68 No Bid
‘This jacket should be light weight with stretch, this flecce has a cotton hand and wicks moisture..
Size 4XL $47.68 No Bid
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Cintas Corporation

Bid Name: Uniforms Purchase Southern Specialty Products LLC
337-474-9090 office
Bid Number: SB-2025-CPPJ-102 137-438.3579 cell 337-794-4392
Personnel: CPPJ Departments Charle McAdon Corey Hale
Effective: March 7, 2025 until November 30, 2025 char com hale2@cintas.com
Non-responsive
Product Material and Product Material and
Item # Description Size Part Number Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price
Sport-Tek, Men's Fleece 1/4 Zip Size XS - XL $36.58 No Bid
Size 2XL $38.58 No Bid
7.40z 70/25/5
58 . STs61 STS61 )
Size 3XL poly/rayon/spandex $40.58 No Bid
This jacket should be light weight with stretch, this fleece has a cotton hand and wicks moisture.
Size 4XL $42.58 No Bid

Page 9 of 19



mailto:charles@southernspecialtyproducts.com
mailto:charles@southernspecialtyproducts.com
mailto:hale2@cintas.com
mailto:hale2@cintas.com
mailto:charles@southernspecialtyproducts.com
mailto:hale2@cintas.com

Bid Name: Uniforms Purchase Southern Specialty Products LLC Cintas Corporation
337474-9090 office
-2025-CPPJ- 337-794-4392
Bid Number SB-2025-CPPJ-102 pliny by 3 39
Personnet CPPJ Departments Charle McAdon Corey Hale
Effective March 7, 2025 until November 30, 2025 char com hale2@cintas.com
Non-responsive
Product Material and Product Material and
Item # Description Size Part Number Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price
Green Team Rain Jacket Size XS - XL $116.48 No Bid
Size 2XL 00% polyester shell and 118.48 No Bid
This jacket should be a light-weight shell design similar to the Eddie Bauer Rain jacket, style number EBSS50. Features 12¢ Jini ° Fl'ooy,,/ ) $ o Bl
59 include: waterproof, breathable, seam-sealed; attached, fully adjustable hood with hidden draw cord system; brushed chin X EBS550 1332 ing 70 ny on Zip- X
guard lining' center front zip and Velcro closure pit-zip vents; two secure-zip hand pockets; and adjustable Velero cuff tabs Size 3XL inner jacket with 100% $120.48 No Bid
and hem cinch-cord. Fabric material to be equal to 40D 85 g/n? (2.99 oz./yd?) Hyvent®, or equal, 2.5L - 100% nylon polyester i
tipstop. Waterproofing to be warranted for the life of the jacket. Jacket should come in multiple color choices, one color
option must be red. One color screen print on front of jacket, two lines, total length and width is approx. 1"H x 4"L. Size 4XL $122.48 No Bid
Men’s Propper Canvas Pant Waist Size 28 - 40 42.49 No Bid
5 y 8.50z 65% polyester 35%
60 Waist Size 42 - 46 F5252-50 F5252-50 o 4249 No Bid
Tactical Trousers 65 Poly/35 Cotton Canvas. Fade and wrinkle resistant with a Teflon coating that repels liquid and stains. cotton canvas teflon
Color choices should include khak, coyote and black.
Waist Size 48 and above 42.49 No Bid
Women'’s Dickies Pant Size 2-10 $34.99 No Bid
. . Toz stretch twill 97% cotton
61 Size 12-18 FP321 FP321 3% spand ° $34.99 No Bid
Women's relaxed straight stretch twill pant with a hook and eye closure. Pants st slightly below the waist and should be 3% spandex
available in multiple color choices including khaki.
Size 20-24 $34.99 No Bid
Women'’s Dickies Pant Size 2-10 $34.99 No Bid
. . 7oz stretch twill 97% cotton
62 Size 12-18 FP322 FP322 ’ $34.99 No Bid
3% spandex
Women's relaxed fit fat front pant. Should come available in multiple color choices including khaki
Size 20-24 $34.99 No Bid
Women's Work Pant Susan Fit Size 2-10 No Bid No Bid
63 |Both pants should be available i a cargo pant style. Material will be @ 65/35 poly/cotton comfurt flcx, or cqual Fit should Size 12-18 388 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
be equal to that described above for the Susan and/or Cathy Fit. Color choices should include khaki, black, navy, charcoal,
“e Size 20-24 No Bid No Bid
Women's Work Pant Cathy Fit Size 2-10 No Bid No Bid
64 IIBoth pants should be available i a cargo pant style, Material will be @ 65/35 poly/cotton comfurt flcx, or cqual Fit should Size 12-18 389 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
be equal to that described above for the Susan and/or Cathy Fit. Color choices should include khaki, black, navy, charcoal,
“e Size 20-24 No Bid No Bid
. Waist Size 28-40 $71.40 No Bid
Men’s Stryke Pant
Pants will be equal to, or exceed, the specifications of the 5.11 Tactical Stryke Pant, available in multiple colors including i .
65 Storm (Color # 092), Khaki (Color #055), TDU Green (Color # 190), and Dark Navy (Color # 724), and Black (Color # Waist Size 42-46 74369 74369 65% polyester 35% cotton $71.40 No Bid
019). Pants will come with the following features: Two-way stretch fabric, Teflon stain and soil resistant finish, reinforced
front thigh utility pockets, badge holder front belt loops, double knee with nterior knee pad pocket, YKK zippers and Prym
snaps, and quick access, low-profile patented pockets. Waist Size 48 and above $71.40 No Bid
Size 2-10 $71.40 No Bid
‘Women’s Stryke Pant
Pants will be equal to, or exceed, the specifications of the 5.11 Tactical Stryke Pant, available in multiple colors including ) o
66 Storm (Color # 092), Khaki (Color #055), TDU Green (Color # 190), and Dark Navy (Color # 724), and Black (Color # Size 12-18 64386 64386 65% polyester 35% cotton $71.40 No Bid
019). Pants will come with the following features: Two-way stretch fabric, Teflon stain and soil resistant finish, reinforced
front thigh utility pockets, badge holder front belt loops, double knee with interior knce pad pocket, YKK zippers and Prym
snaps, and quick access, low-profile patented pockets Size 20-24 $71.40 No Bid
Men's Pant 5.11 Waist Size 28-40 $49.30 No Bid
7| Pants ill becqual t, or exceed, he specifictionsofthe 5.11 Tacica brand; model Taclie Pro Pants availabl in muliple Waist Size 42-46 2073 2073 regular fit 65% polyester $49.30 No Bid
colors including Khaki (Color # 162), Green (Color # 190), Black (Color #019), and Dark Navy (Color # 724). Pants will 35% cotton
come with the following features: Lightweigh, breathable and comfortable; Idcal for outdoor activities: Seven-pocket
configuration; Signature 5.11 strap and slash rear pockets; Teflon treatment for stain, soil, and spill resistance; action o )
waistband; full gusseted crotch; and hip-mounted D-ring holds keys or ID. Waist Size 48 and above $49.30 No Bid
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Bid Name: Uniforms Purchase Southern Specialty Products LLC Cintas Corporation
337-474-9090 office
2025-CPPJ- 337-794-4392
Bid Number $B-2025-CPPJ-102 pliny by 3 39
Personnel: CPPJ Departments Charle McAdon Corey Hale
Effective: March 7, 2025 until November 30, 2025 char com hale2@cintas.com
Non-responsive
Product Material and Product Material and
Item # Description Size Part Number Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price
Women's Pant 5.1 Size 2-10 $49.30 No Bid
Pants will be equal to, or exceed, the specifications of the 5.11 Tactical brand; model Taclite Pro Pants available in multiple regular fit 65% polyester .
68 | cotors including Khaki (Color # 162), Green (Color # 190), Black (Color #019), and Dark Navy (Color # 724). Pants will Size 12-18 64360 64360 35% cotton $49.30 No Bid
come with the following features: Lightweight, breathable and comfortable; Ideal for outdoor activities; Seven-pock
configuration; Signature 5.11 strap and slash rear pockets; Teflon treatment for stain, soil, and spill rsistance; action ]
‘waistband; full gusseted crotch; and hip-mounted D-ring holds keys or ID. Size 20-24 $49.30 No Bid
. N Waist Size 28-40 $35.74 No Bid
Propper Men's BDU Trousers
65% polyester 35% cotton )
69 Waist Size 42-46 F5201-38 F5201-39 o P yripmp ’ $35.74 No Bid
Propper Men’s BDU Trousers, Pt. # F5201-38; 65/35 polyester/cotton; black in color.
Waist Size 48 and above $35.74 No Bid
Propper Pants Size 2-10 $55.24 No Bid
F5243-50 (disc) new item 6.50z 64% polyester 32% .
70 Size 12-18 F5243-50 &Lszs)g o oo $55.24 No Bid
Pants should be equal to the Propper Pt. # F5243-50, 65/35 poly/cotton and be available in color choices of coyote and cotton 4% spandex
navy.
Size 20-24 $55.24 No Bid
Waist Size 28-40 $42.49 No Bid
Pants will be equal to or exceed the specification of the Propper Lightweight Tactile Trousers, 65/35 poly/cotton Ripstop Waist Size 42-46 $42.49 NoBid
with Dupont Teflon, and be fade, Shrink and wrinkle resistant. Dupont Teflon fabric protector reels stains and liquids, low , o
71 profile appearance for use both on and off duty and includes D-ring for keys or tools. Extra-large belt loops designed for F5252 FF252 6.50264% E"'ye“e" 32%
nylon duty belt, action-stretch waistband for enhanced comfort, reinforced knee and seat. Zipper fly with sturdy snap cotton 4% spandex
closure, nine-pocket design, two cargo pockets with hook and loop closure, and two hook and loop back pockets with wallet
“pocket in a pocket™. Two front pockets with reinforced opening for folding knife or tool clip. Internal opening forknee | Waist Size 48 and above $42.49 No Bid
pads and cell phone pocket with hook and loop closure. Two hidden coin pockets and should come with a free, matching
belt. Color choices will be coyote, black and dark navy.
‘Women’s Tactile Trousers Size 2-10 $42.49 No Bid
Pants will be equal to or exceed the specification of the Propper Lightweight Tactile Trousers, 65/35 poly/cotton Ripstop Size 12-18 $42.49 NoBid
with Dupont Teflon, and be fade, Shrink and wrinkle resistant. Dupont Teflon fabric protector reels stains and liquids, low ) N
7 profile appearance for use both on and off duty and includes D-ring for keys or tools. Extra-large belt loops designed for F5254 F5297 6.402 65% polyester 35%
nylon duty belt, action-stretch waistband for enhanced comfort, reinforced knee and seat. Zipper fly with sturdy snap cotton ripstop w/teflon
closure, nine-pocket design, two cargo pockets with hook and loop closure, and two hook and loop back pockets with wallet
“pocket in a pocket™. Two front pockets with reinforced opening for folding knife or tool clip. Internal opening for knee Size 20-24 $42.49 No Bid
pads and cell phone pocket with hook and loop closure. Two hidden coin pockets and should come with a free, matching
belt. Color choices will be coyote, black and dark navy.
Hats and Caps
73 Knit Cap Per Each 131 TKN24 Acrylic $15.00 No Bid
Cap is to be 100% acrylic knit with fold up cuff and available in multiple colors including high No Bid
visibility yellow
5.11 Caps Qty.0-12 $14.50 No Bid
Qty. 13-24 . . $14.50 No Bid
2 $9260 §9260 lightweight druable DWR
Caps will be equal to, or exceed, the specifications of the 5.1 Part #89260. Hat is made of fade resistant poly/cotton twill Tinish adjustable strap
that repels stains, soils, and liquids. Hat has a fully adjustable strap so one size fits all. Should come in multiple color Qty. 25-36 $14.50 No Bid
choices including Navy. Hats will include a two line, one color embroidery.
Qty. 37 and above $14.50 No Bid
Soft Mesh Cap w/ embroidery Qty.0-12 $10.93 No Bid
ty. 13-24 -4 1 struct $10.93 No Bid
Caps should be soft mesh baseball style caps, equal to Cobra PKL, solid material on the brim and front panels and mesh for Qty PKL PKL h(' }:’ an;cap unstruc “k' ed
75 | the sides and rear of the cap. Cap style should be medium profile and constructed 0f65/35 poly/catton. Cap closure should igh performance quick dry
be hook-and-eye strap closer or equal. Cap should be available in multiple color choices, however only one color at a time Qty. 25-36 jersey mesh $10.93 No Bid

awill be ordered. Bid price will include a one-color Parish logo, centered, on the front panel of the cap which
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Southern Specialty Products LLC

Cintas Corporation

Bid Name: Uniforms Purchase
. 337-474-9090 office
Bid Number: SB-2025-CPPJ-102 137-438.3579 cell 337-794-4392
Personnel: CPPJ Departments Charle McAdon Corey Hale
Effective: March 7, 2025 until November 30, 2025 char com hale2@cintas.com
Non-responsive
Product Material and Product Material and
Item # Description Size Part Number Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price
will contrast with the cap color.
No Bid

Qty. 37 and above

$10.93
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Southern Specialty Products LLC

Cintas Corporation

Bid Name: Uniforms Purchase
3374749090 office
Bid Number. SB-2025-CPPJ-102 i 337-7944392
Personnel: CPPJ Departments Charle McAdon Corey Hale
Effectve: March 7, 2025 until November 30,2025 char hale2@cintas.com
Non-responsive
Product Material and Product Material and
Item # Description Size Part Number Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price
Solid Panel Cap w/ embroidery Quy.0-12 $9.10 No Bid
Caps should be bascball style caps, equal to Cobra GPV, solid material on the brim and solid panels all around. Cap style 1324 oanel 3 1/4" structure $9.10 No Bid
should be medium profile and constructed 0 65/35 poly/cotton. Cap closure should be hook-and-eye strap closure or equal. Qty g5332 G (’.pd"d 3 1/4‘ “mf‘:'_t‘d
76 | Cap should be available in multiple color choices, however only one color at a time will be ordered. Bid price must include S PV crown garment washet
a one-color Parish logo, centered, embroidered on the front panel of the cap which will contrast with the cap color. As Qty.25-36 cotton twill $9.10 No Bid
sipulated above, “Calcasieu Parish” and “Police Jury” will be embroidered in opposing semi-circles around the logo on the
front of the cap. On the rear of the hat above the hook-and-cye strap closure departments may request their names be -
embroidered such as Dept. of Public Works; Facility Management; Engineering, ctc Qty. 37 and above $9.10 No Bid
.
Tee-Shirts
Tee-Shirt w/ pocket (1 color, 2 locations) Size S - XL
Quy- 1-20 100% cotton w/pocket note: Slalo No Bid
) safety pink safety green neon
Qty.21-40 2000 G530 green graphite Hir: heather $14.75 NoBid
iant orchi 1
Tee-Shirt should be 100% cotton with a crew neck with pocket on left chest avalable in multiple colors including gold Qty. 41 - 60 radiant orchid S0/50 blend $12.75 No Bid
Qty. 60+ $12.00 No Bid
Tee-Shirt w/ pocket (1 color, 2 locations) Size 2XL - 3XL
Qty. 1-20 $18.00 No Bid
77 Qty. 21 - 40 2000 G530 100% cotton w/pocket $16.75 No Bid
Tee-Shirt should be 100% cotton with a crew neck with pocket on left chest avalable in multiple colors including gold Qty. 41-60 $14.75 No Bid
Qty. 60+ $14.00 No Bid
Tee-Shirt w/ pocket (1 color, 2 locations) Size 4XL and above
Qty. 1-20 $19.00 No Bid
Qty. 21 -40 2000 G230 100% cotton w/pocket $17.00 No Bid
Tee-Shirt should be 100% cotton with a crew neck with pocket on left chest avalable in multiple colors including gold
Qty. 41 - 60 $16.00 No Bid
Qty. 60+ $15.00 No Bid
Short Sleeve (1 color, 1 location) Size S - XL
Qty. 1-20 $9.25 No Bid
Qty. 21 -40 8000 G800/8000 50/50 cotton/poly $8.75 No Bid
Gildan Dry blend 8000 o equal with no pocket, 50/50 cotton/polyester crew neck, available in long and short seeve, and
available in multiple color choices including red, black, and dark gray. Qty. 41-60 $7.75 No Bid
Qty. 60+ $7.00 No Bid
Short Sleeve (1 color, 1 location) Size 2XL - 3XL
Qty. 1-20 $13.25 No Bid
78 Qty. 21 - 40 8000 G800/8000 50/50 cotton/poly $11.25 No Bid
Gildan Dry blend 8000 or equal with no pocket, 50/50 cotton/polyester crew neck, available in long and short sleeve, and .
available in multiple color choices including red, black, and dark gray. Qty. 41 - 60 $10.75 NoBid
Qty. 60+ $10.00 No Bid
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Bid Name: Uniforms Purchase Southern Specialty Products LLC Cintas Corporation
. 337-474-9090 office
Bid Number: SB-2025-CPPJ-102 137-438.3579 cell 337-794-4392
Personnel: CPPJ Departments Charle McAdon Corey Hale
Effective: March 7, 2025 until November 30, 2025 char com hale2@cintas.com
Non-responsive
Product Material and Product Material and
Item # Description Size Part Number Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price
Short Sleeve (1 color, 1 location) Size 4XL and above
Qty. 1-20 $15.00 No Bid
Qty. 21 -40 8000 G800/3000 50/50 cotton/poly $13.00 No Bid
Gildan Dry blend 8000 or equal with no pocket, 50/50 cotton/polyester crew neck, available in long and short sleeve, and
available in multiple color choices including red, black, and dark gray.
Qty. 41 - 60 $12.50 No Bid
Qty. 60+ $12.00 No Bid
Short Sleeve (1 color, 2 locations) Size S - XL
Qty. 1-20 $13.50 No Bid
Qty. 21 - 40 8000 G800/8000 50/50 cotton/poly $12.50 No Bid
Gildan Dry blend 8000 or equal with no pocket, 50/50 cotton/polyester crew neck, available in long and short sleeve, and
available in multiple color choices including red, black, and dark gray. Qty. 41-60 $10.50 No Bid
Qty. 60+ $9.25 No Bid
Short Sleeve (1 color, 2 locations) Size 2XL - 3XL
Qty. 1-20 $16.50 No Bid
79 Qty. 21 -40 8000 G800/8000 50/50 cotton/poly $15.50 No Bid
Gildan Dry blend 8000 or equal with no pocket, 50/50 cotton/polyester crew neck, available in long and short sleeve, and
available in multiple color choices including red, black, and dark gray. Qty. 41 - 60 $13.50 No Bid
Qty. 60+ $12.00 No Bid
Short Sleeve (1 color, 2 locations) Size 4XL and above
Qty. 1-20 $18.00 No Bid
Qty. 21 -40 8000 G800/8000 50/50 cotton/poly $17.00 No Bid
Gildan Dry blend 8000 or equal with no pocket, 50/50 cotton/polyester crew neck, available in long and short sleeve, and
available in multiple color choices including red, black, and dark gray.
Qty. 41 - 60 $15.00 No Bid
Qty. 60+ $14.00 No Bid
Long Sleeve (1 color, 2 location) Size S XL
Qty. 1-20 $19.00 No Bid
Qty. 21 -40 8000 PC55LS 50/50 cotton/poly $15.00 No Bid
Gildan Dry blend 8000 or equal with no pocket, 50/50 cotton/polyester crew neck, available in long and short sleeve, and
available in multiple color choices including red, black, and dark gray. Qty. 41 - 60 $12.25 No Bid
Qty. 60+ $12.00 No Bid
Long Sleeve (1 color, 2 location) Size 2XL - 3XL
Qty. 1-20 $23.00 No Bid
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Bid Name: Uniforms Purchase Southern Specialty Products LLC Cintas Corporation
337-474-9090 office
Bid Number: SB-2025-CPPJ-102 $37-438.3579 cell 337-794-4392
Personnk CPPJ Departments Charle McAdon Corey Hale
Effective: March 7,2025 until November 30, 2025 com hale2@cintas.com
Non-responsive
Product Material and Product Material and
Item # Description Size Part Number Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price
80 Qty. 21 - 40 800 PCSSLS 50/50 cotton/poly $18.00 No Bid
Gildan Dry blend 8000 or equal with no pocket, 50/50 cotton/polyester crew neck, available in long and short sleeve, and
available in multiple color choices including red, black, and dark gray. Qty. 41-60 $15.25 No Bid
Qty. 60+ $15.00 No Bid
Long Sleeve (1 color, 2 location) Size 4XL and above
Qty. 1-20 $25.00 No Bid
Qty. 21 - 40 8000 PCSSLS/PCSSLST 50/50 cotton/poly $20.00 No Bid
Gildan Dry blend 8000 or equal with no pocket, 50/50 cotton/polyester crew neck, available in long and short sleeve, and
available in multiple color choices including red, black, and dark gray.
Qty. 41 - 60 $17.25 No Bid
Qty. 60+ $17.00 No Bid
Short Sleeve (5 color, 2 locations) Size S — XL
Qty. 21 -40 $18.50 No Bid
8000 G800/8000 50/50 cotton/poly
Qty. 41 - 60 $17.95 No Bid
Qty. 60+ $17.50 No Bid
Short Sleeve (S color, 2 locations) Size 2XL - 3XL
Qty. 21 -40 $21.50 No Bid
381 8000 G800/8000 50/50 /pol.
Qty. 41 - 60 $21.00 No Bid
Qty. 60+ $20.00 No Bid
Short Sleeve (5 color, 2 locations) Size 4XL and above No Bid
Qty. 21 -40 $23.50 No Bid
8000 G800/8000 50/50 /pol.
Qty. 41 - 60 $23.00 No Bid
Qty. 60+ $22.00 No Bid
Long Sleeve (5 colors, 2 locations) Size S - XL No Bid
Qty. 21 -40 $23.25 No Bid
8000 PCS5LS 50/50 /pol.
Qty. 41 - 60 $22.50 No Bid
Qty. 60+ $22.00 No Bid
Long Sleeve (5 colors, 2 locations) Size 2XL - 3XL No Bid
Qty. 21 - 40 $26.25 No Bid
82 8000 PC55LS 50/50 pol.
Qty. 41 - 60 $25.50 No Bid
Qty. 60+ $25.00 No Bid
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Bid Name: Uniforms Purchase Southern Specialty Products LLC Cintas Corporation
337-474-9090 office
Bid Number: SB-2025-CPPJ-102 $37-438.3579 cell 337-794-4392
Personnk CPPJ Departments Charle McAdon Corey Hale
Effective: March 7, 2025 until November 30, 2025 char com hale2@cintas.com
Non-responsive
Product Material and Product Material and
Item # Description Size Part Number Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price
p
Long Sleeve (5 colors, 2 locations) Size 4XL and above
Qty. 21 -40 $28.00 No Bid
8000 PCS5LS/PCS5LST 50/50 /pol.
Qty. 41 - 60 $27.50 No Bid
Qty. 60+ $27.00 No Bid
Tee shirt (1 color, 1 location) Size S - XL
Qty. 1-20 $10.25 No Bid
Qty. 21 - 40 2000 G200/2000 100% pre shrunk cotton $8.50 No Bid
Tee-shirts should be heavyweight, 6 oz. 100% pre-shrunk cotton with double-needle collar, sleeves, and waist. Tee-shirts
should be available in multiple colors and sizes Qty.41-60 $§7.50 No Bid
Qty. 60+ $7.00 No Bid
Tee shirt (1 color, 1 location) Size 2XL - 3XL
Qty. 1-20 $14.00 No Bid
83
2000 G200/2000 100% pre shrunk cotton .
Tee-shirts should be heavyweight, 6 0z. 100% pre-shrunk cotton with double-needle collar, sleeves, and waist. Tee-shirts Qty. 21-40 $11.75 NoBid
should be available in multiple colors and sizes
Qty. 41 - 60 $11.25 No Bid
Qty. 60+ $10.00 No Bid
Tee shirt (1 color, 1 location) Size 4XL and above
Qty. 1-20 $15.00 No Bid
Qty. 21 - 40 2000 G200/2000 100% pre shrunk cotton $14.00 No Bid
Tee-shirts should be heavyweight, 6 oz. 100% pre-shrunk cotton with double-needle collar, sleeves, and waist. Tee-shirts
should be available in multiple colors and sizes Quy. 41-60 $13.00 No Bid
Qty. 60+ $12.00 No Bid
Tee-Shirt (1 color, 2 locations) Size S - XL
Qty. 1-20 $14.50 No Bid
.21 -40 2000 G200/2000 100% pre shrunk cotton $11.00 No Bid
ty.
Tee-shirts should be heavyweight, 6 oz. 100% pre-shrunk cotton with double-needle collar, sleeves, and waist. Tee-shirts
should be available in multiple colors and sizes Qty.41-60 $9.75 No Bid
Qty. 60+ $9.00 No Bid
Tee-Shirt (1 color, 2 locations) Size 2XL - 3XL
Qty. 1-20 $18.25 No Bid
84
2000 G200/2000 100% pre shrunk cotton .
Tee-shirts should be heavyweight, 6 0z. 100% pre-shrunk cotton with double-needle collar, sleeves, and waist. Tee-shirts Qty. 21-40 $14.75 NoBid
should be available in multiple colors and sizes
Qty. 41 - 60 $13.50 No Bid
Qty. 60+ $13.00 No Bid

Tee-Shirt (1 color, 2 locations)

Size 4XL and above
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Cintas Corporation

Bid Name: Uniforms Purchase Southern Specialty Products LLC
337-474-9090 office
Bid Number: SB-2025-CPPJ-102 137-438.3579 cell 337-794-4392
Personnel: CPPJ Departments Charle McAdon Corey Hale
Effective: March 7, 2025 until November 30, 2025 char com hale2@cintas.com
Non-responsive
Product Material and Product Material and
Item # Description Size Part Number Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price
Qty. 1-20 $19.25 No Bid
Qty. 21 - 40 2000 G200/2000 100% pre shrunk cotton $15.75 No Bid
Tee-shirts should be heavyweight, 6 oz. 100% pre-shrunk cotton with double-needle collar, sleeves, and waist. Tee-shirts
should be available in multiple colors and sizes Qty. 41-60 $14.50 No Bid
Qty. 60+ $14.00 No Bid
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Bid Name: Uniforms Purchase Southern Specialty Products LLC Cintas Corporation
3374749090 office
Bid Number: SB-2025-CPPJ-102 3374383579 cell 337-794-4392
Persomnel CPPJ Departments Charle McAdon Corey Hale
Effective March 7, 2025 until November 30, 2025 hale2@cintas.com
Non-responsive
Product Material and Product Material and
Item # Description Size Part Number Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price
Safety T-shirt (1 color, 1 location) Size S— XL
Qty. 21-40 N :'“’7 '“““}/‘" P‘t’]'yef‘erz $20.00 No Bid
. irdseye mesh reflective 2-
60859 8200 inch tape meets ANSI 104 -
Qty. 41 - 60 requirements $19.00 No Bid
Qiy. 60+ $18.00 No Bid
Safety T-shirt (1 color, 1 location) Size 2XL — 3XL
4.102 100% polyester -
85 Qty. 21-40 0859 5200 birdseye mesh reflective 2- $24.00 No Bid
inch tape meets ANSI 104
Qty. 41 - 60 requirements $26.00 No Bid
Qty. 60+ $28.00 No Bid
Safety T-shirt (1 color, 1 location) Size 4XL and above
4.102 100% polyester -
Qty. 21-40 birdseye mesh reflective 2- $26.00 No Bid
60859 5200 inch tape meets ANSI 104
Qty. 41 - 60 P N $28.00 No Bid
requirements
Qty. 60+ $30.00 No Bid
Safety Long Sleeve (1 color, 1 location) Size S - XL
Qty. 21-40 i : loz IOOZ" p‘:]"“:.‘crz $23.00 No Bid
irdseye mesh reflective 2-
60859 es201 inch tape meets ANSI 104
Qty. 41-60 requirements $22.00 No Bid
Qty. 60+ $20.00 No Bid
Safety Long Sleeve (1 color, 1 location) Size 2XL - 3XL
4.102 100% polyester
86 Quy.21-40 0859 csa01 birdseye mesh reflective 2- 2D NoBid
inch tape meets ANSI 104
Qty. 41-60 requirements $26.00 No Bid
Qiy. 60+ $24.00 No Bid
Safety Long Sleeve (1 color, 1 location) Size 4XL and above
4.102 100% polyester
Qty.-21-40 . birdseye mesh reflective 2- $32.00 NoBid
60859 €s201 P
inch tape meets ANSI 104 -
Qty. 41 - 60 ! $31.00 No Bid
Qiy. 60+ $29.00 No Bid
Aprons & Smocks
87 Cobbler apron unisex - 3 pockets with side ties A705 A705 80z 65/35 poly/cotton twill $22.00 No Bid
88 Button front smock water resistant with pockets CK-1602 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Patches
89 American Flag Patch % 100 per lot N/A $1.40 No Bid
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Cintas Corporation

Bid Name: Uniforms Purchase Southern Specialty Products LLC
337-474-9090 office
Bid Number: SB-2025-CPPJ-102 137-438.3579 cell 337-794-4392
Personnel: CPPJ Departments Charle McAdon Corey Hale
Effective: March 7, 2025 until November 30, 2025 char com hale2@cintas.com
Non-responsive
Product Material and Product Material and
Item # Description Size Part Number Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price
90 Reverse American Flag Patch a 100 per lot N/A $1.40 No Bid
91 Calcasieu Parish Animal Services and Adoption Center Patches . 100 per lot N/A $2.50 No Bid
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