Cintas Corporation

Bid Name: Uniforms Purchase
Bid Number: SB-2024-CPPJ-166 337-439-5755
Personnel: CPPJ Departments Corey Hale
Effective: December 20, 2024 until November 30, 2025 halec2@cintas.com
Product Material and
Item # Description Size Part Number Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price
$1.62-813.77
Additional fee for “tall” range depending on size
A Fee for “Tall” size. Fee applies to all shirts in this bid. regardless of shirt size - *
$5.62
Embroidery. Fee applies to all garments in this bid. Embroidery up to 5,000 starting amount for 1 pe
B ALL PARISH DEPARTMENTS ARE TO ONLY HAVE SINGLE COLOR EMBROIDERY stitches - **
$10.48
. . S . starting amount for 1 pc
Embroidery. Fee applies to all garments in this bid. Embroidery up to 10,000 g 1
C ALL PARISH DEPARTMENTS ARE TO ONLY HAVE SINGLE COLOR EMBROIDERY stitches - **
$4
Sewing on Patches of starting amount for 1 pc
D Sewing on Patches. Fee applies to sewing on Parish Patches to all garments on this bid various sizes
Additional fee for each
added screen print color that
Additional screen print color for Tee-shirts that include screen printing. is in addition to the number
Ex: If a shirt has a two color screen print, what is the additional cost to make it a three color of colors stated in the bid
E screen print. item
. Size S - XL NO BID
Horace Small brand jacket
1 Jacket price to include Orange/Silver Reflective 1 !4” tape on horizontal upper back and horizontal under pocket. Jacket Size 2XL — 3XL HS3352 NO BID
color will be black. Jacket will have an American Flag patch sewn on the right sleeve and an Animal Services patch sewn
on the left sleeve. The patches will be provided by the Parish to the awarded Vendor. Bid price will be inclusive of the
required sewing. Size 4XL and above NO BID
Work Pants for Men Plain Waist Size 28 - 40 $33.60
51% polyester
2 The 945 pants should be designed as “relaxed” pants with a roomy cut for comfort and both the 945 and 865 should be Waist Size 42 - 46 945 23945 27% cotton canvas $40.60
constructed of 65/35 poly/cotton fabric. Bidder should offer multiple waist sizes up to 50”. Extended sizes should be 22% polyester stretch
available. Color choices should include khaki, black, navy, charcoal, etc. Waist Size 48 and above $43.60
Work Pants for Men Pleated Waist Size 28 - 40 $28.34
. . s 5% polyester
3 The 945 pants should be designed as “relaxed” pants with a roomy cut for comfort and both the 945 and 865 should be Waist Size 42 - 46 865 865 359% cott $35.34
constructed of 65/35 poly/cotton fabric. Bidder should offer multiple waist sizes up to 50”. Extended sizes should be o cotton
available. Color choices should include khaki, black, navy, charcoal, etc. Waist Size 48 and above $38.34
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Bid Name:

Uniforms Purchase

Cintas Corporation

Bid Number: SB-2024-CPPJ-166 337-439-5755
Personnel: CPPJ Departments Corey Hale
Effective: December 20, 2024 until November 30, 2025 halec2@cintas.com
Product Material and
Item # Description Size Part Number Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price
Cargo Work Pants for Men Waist Size 28 - 40 $34.84
51% polyester
4 Men’s cargo pants equal to Cintas Pt. # 270 should be constructed of 65/35 poly/cotton comfort flex fabric, or equal. Waist Size 42 - 46 270 23270 27% cotton canvas $41.84
Pants will offer a relaxed cut and have two exterior cargo pockets. Color choices should include khaki, black, navy, 22% polyester stretch
charcoal, etc. Extended sizes should be available. Waist Size 48 and above $44.84
Women’s Dickies Pant Size 2-10 NO BID
5 Size 12-18 FP321 NO BID
Women’s relaxed straight stretch twill pant with a hook and eye closure. Pants sit slightly below the waist and should be
available in multiple color choices including khaki.
Size 20-24 NO BID
Women'’s Dickies Pant Size 2-10 NO BID
6 Size 12-18 FP322 NO BID
‘Women's relaxed fit flat front pant. Should come available in multiple color choices including khaki.
Size 20-24 NO BID
Women's Work Pant Ladies ComforFlex Size 2-10 $30.77
42% polyester
7 Pants should offer spacious pockets including a hidden pocket on the right leg. Straight leg cut that easily fits over boots. Size 12-18 23390 23390 36% stretch polyester $37.77
Interior stretch waistband for added mobility and comfort. 7.9 oz. twill, 42% polyester/36% stretch polyester/22% cotton. 22% cotton
Color choices should include khaki, black, navy, charcoal, etc.00 Size 20-24 $40.77
Women's Work Pant Susan Fit Size 2-10 NO BID
8 Both pants should be available in a cargo pant style. Material will be a 65/35 poly/cotton comfort flex, or equal. Fit Size 12-18 388 NO BID
should be equal to that described above for the Susan and/or Cathy Fit. Color choices should include khaki, black, navy,
S Size 20-24 NO BID
Women's Work Pant Cathy Fit Size 2-10 NO BID
9 Both pants should be available in a cargo pant style. Material will be a 65/35 poly/cotton comfort flex, or equal. Fit Size 12-18 389 NO BID
should be equal to that described above for the Susan and/or Cathy Fit. Color choices should include khaki, black, navy,
SITILER Size 20-24 NO BID
Tee-Shirt
Short Sleeve (5 color, 2 locations) Size S — XL 50% coft
cotton
8000 67222 S0% olvester
Gildan Dry blend 8000 or equal with no pocket, 50/50 cotton/polyester crew neck, available in long and short sleeve, and Qty. 1-20 o polyes $6.27 (blank)

available in multiple color choices including red, black, and dark gray.
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Bid Name: Uniforms Purchase Cintas Corporation
Bid Number: SB-2024-CPPJ-166 337-439-5755
Personnel: CPPJ Departments Corey Hale
Effective: December 20, 2024 until November 30, 2025 halec2@cintas.com
Product Material and
Item # Description Size Part Number Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price
Short Sleeve (5 color, 2 locations) Size 2XL - 3XL 65% nolvest
o polyester
8000 67222
10 35% cotton
Gildan Dry blend 8000 or equal with no pocket, 50/50 cotton/polyester crew neck, available in long and short sleeve, and Qty. 1-20 $14.07
available in multiple color choices including red, black, and dark gray.
Short Sleeve (5 color, 2 locations) Size 4XL and above
8000 67222 Heather sport royal
Gildan Dry blend 8000 or equal with no pocket, 50/50 cotton/polyester crew neck, available in long and short sleeve, and ty. 1 - 20 $13.43
available in multiple color choices including red, black, and dark gray. Qty. 1- .
Long Sleeve (5 colors, 2 locations) Size S - XL $5.25-8975 (blank)
50% cotton
8000 67222 o
50% polyester
Gildan Dry blend 8000 or equal with no pocket, 50/50 cotton/polyester crew neck, available in long and short sleeve, and Qty. 1-20 $12.79
available in multiple color choices including red, black, and dark gray.
Long Sleeve (5 colors, 2 locations) Size 2XL — 3XL $6.27 (blank)
1 8000 67222 65% polyester
35% cotton
Gildan Dry blend 8000 or equal with no pocket, 50/50 cotton/polyester crew neck, available in long and short sleeve, and Qty. 1-20 $14.07
available in multiple color choices including red, black, and dark gray.
Long Sleeve (5 colors, 2 locations) Size 4XL and above $14.30-$18.50 (blank)
8000 67222 Heather sport royal
Gildan Dry blend 8000 or equal with no pocket, 50/50 cotton/polyester crew neck, available in long and short sleeve, and Qty. 1-20 $15.99
available in multiple color choices including red, black, and dark gray. y- 1 :
Safety T-shirt (1 color, 1 location) Size 2XL — 3XL $13.83 (blank)
0, 3
Shirt will have 2” Silver Reflective Tape horizontal around the shirt in mid-section and 2” reflective tape that connects to 60859 77603 100% polyester
the horizontal tape in the front and back of the shirt and runs up and over each shoulder- Cintas Style #60859. Shirts Qty. 1-20 $16.23
12 should be 100% moisture wicking and available in both safety orange and safety yellow.
Safety T-shirt (1 color, 1 location) Size 4XL and above $16.23 (blank)
Shirt will have 2 Silver Reflective Tape horizontal around the shirt in mid-section and 2™ reflective tape that connects to 60859 77603 100% polyester
the horizontal tape in the front and back of the shirt and runs up and over each shoulder- Cintas Style #60859. Shirts Qty. 1-20 $22.63
should be 100% moisture wicking and available in both safety orange and safety yellow.
Safety Long Sleeve (1 color, 1 location) Size S — XL $25.91 (blank)
0,
Shirt will have 2 Silver Reflective Tape horizontal around the shirt in mid-section and 2" reflective tape that connects to 60859 65386 100% polyester
the horizontal tape in the front and back of the shirt and runs up and over each shoulder- Cintas Style #60859. Shirts Qty. 1-20 $28.31
should be 100% moisture wicking and available in both safety orange and safety yellow.
Safety Long Sleeve (1 color, 1 location) Size 2XL — 3XL $27.51 (blank)
13 60859 65386 100% polyester

Shirt will have 2 Silver Reflective Tape horizontal around the shirt in mid-section and 2” reflective tape that connects to

the horizontal tape in the front and back of the shirt and runs up and over each shoulder- Cintas Style #60859. Shirts Qty. 1-20 $30.32
should be 100% moisture wicking and available in both safety orange and safety yellow.
Safety Long Sleeve (1 color, 1 location) Size 4XL and above $29.91 (blank)
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Bid Name: Uniforms Purchase Cintas Corporation
Bid Number: SB-2024-CPPJ-166 337-439-5755
Personnel: CPPJ Departments Corey Hale
Effective: December 20, 2024 until November 30, 2025 halec2@cintas.com
Product Material and
Item # Description Size Part Number Vendor Part Number Percentage Each Price
Shirt will have 2 Silver Reflective Tape horizontal around the shirt in mid-section and 2" reflective tape that connects to 60859 65386 100% polyester
the horizontal tape in the front and back of the shirt and runs up and over each shoulder- Cintas Style #60859. Shirts Qty. 1-20 $32.31
should be 100% moisture wicking and available in both safety orange and safety yellow.
14 Button front smock water resistant with pockets CK-1602 NO BID
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