Bid Title Mosquito Control Chemicals (Annual Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor
Clarke Mosquito Control ES OPCO LLC DBA Rentokil North America Inc, DBA
Bid Number: $B-2024-MC-155 Products, Inc. Veseris Adapco, LLC Target Specialty Products
Effective Period January 1, 2025 until December 31, 2025 800-323-5727 979-574-5275 407-328-6519 225-291-6164
Dept Personn Mosquito Control Department Miranda Schield John West Andy Pierce, Sr Kirsti Rodney
customercare@clarke.com John.west@veseris.com aes@victorbids@azelis.com kirsti.rodney@target-specialty.com
Joy Edwards David Herter
aes vectororders@azelis.com david herter@target-specialty.com
Tiffany Meguess
aes.vectororders@azelis.com
SECTION &
ITEM # Description — 630-443-3070 (f) NA 866-330-9888 (f) NA
1
30 gallon drum /gal NO BID NO BID NO BID 279.00)
2 Fyfanon EW Insecticide
Jgal 73.84/gal Fyfanon EW is now
30 gallon drum NO BID NO BID| packaged 50 gallons in a 55 gl drum NO BID
3 Fyfanon ULV -
A 55 gallon drum Jgal NO BID BID 92.09) NO BID|
B 275gallon tote Jgal NO BID 64.00/bulk 1000 gal 89.22/gal (260 gl tote) NO BID|
4 Dibrom 14° Concentrate
A 30 gallon drum /gal NO BID NO BID 295.63 NO BID
B 4 or more 30 gallon drums /gil NO BID NO BID 29139 NO BID
5 ReMoa Tri (Triple-Action
A 30 gallon container /gal NO BID NO BID 300.00 NO BID
B 264 gallon container /gal NO BID NO BID 300.00 NO BID|
6 Duet®
A 55 gallon drum /gal 193.32 NO BID NO BID NO BID
B 275 gallon tote /gal 193.32 NO BID NO BID NO BID|
7 Duet® HD
A 55 gallon drum /gal 220.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID
B 275 gallon tote /gal 220.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID|
8 Permanone® 31-66 . .
30 gallon drum /gal 178.35 150.00 146.25 gal /Permasease 31-67| 135.00)
9 Talstar P
A 1gallon /gal NO BID 59.61 NO BID 56.65]
B 4 gallon case /gal NO BID 59.61 58.15 gal /Bifen IT 4x1 gl case 56,65,
10 Demand CS
279.20/cs (8x802) actual case size =
Lcaseof 8/8 oz fes NO BID 300.00 598.50/cs Avesta CS 12X8oz = $418.80/cs
11 ULV Mosquito Master 412 .
A 55 gallon drum /gal 80.76 NO BID NO BID NO BID
B 275 gallon tote /gal 80.76 NO BID NO BID NO BID|
12 DeltaGard .
30 gallon drum /gal NO BID NO BID NO BID 279.00
13 Altosid P35 . . .
31.50/1b $1,260/bag (401b bag)
/lb alternate: Metalarv S-PT Spherical
A 40 Ib bags 20.25 810.00 Pellet 20.25]
20.25 / 20.20 (1,000 1b|
B 1600 Ib (1 pallet) /b 20.25 24240.00 31.50 supersack)/20.20 (2,000 |b tote)|
14 VectoBac® GS Granules
A 40 Ib bags /lb NO BID 1.89 1.84) 1.68 Summit BTI
B 1,600 Ibs (1 pallet) /b NO BID 1.83 1.69] 1.60 Summit BT
15 Vectolex® FG Granules o
A 40 Ib bags /Ib NO BID 5.30 6.84) 5.75 Spheratax SPH 50G |
B 1,600 Ibs (1 pallet) /b NO BID 5.22 6.24 5.50 Spheratax SPH 50G
16 Vectomax® FG o o d d
A 40 Ib bags /Ib NO BID NO BID 9.42] NO BID|
B 1600 Ib (1 pallet) /b NO BID NO BID 5.28] NO BID|
17 Censor Mosquito Larvicide Granules
A 40 Ib bags /Ib 4.38 NO BID NO BID| NO BID|
B 1,400 Ibs (1 pallet) /b 438 NO BID NO BID| NO BID|
18 Duplex G Granules
4.59/1b )40Ib bag) $183.60/bg
A 40 Ib bags e 16.40 16.40 alternate: Vectoprime FG 16.40
B 1,600 Ibs (1 pallet) /b 16.40 16.30) 4.59] 16.40lb / 16.30 (2,000 Ib tote)
19 FOURSTAR 180 Day Microbial Briquests d
220 briquets/case /case 898.78 NO BID NO BID NO BID,
20 ALTOSID XR Briquets
504.00/cs (200 WSP/case)
220 pouches/case fease 866.80 866.80 1,992.00/cs (800 WSP/case) 866.80
21 ALTOSID Pellets WSP d
800 pouches/case /case 800.00 800.00 NO BID :800.00
22 Natular G30 WSP d
500 pouches/case /case 550.28 NO BID NO BID NO BID
23 Sumilary 0.5G Sachets WSP . . .
400 pouches/case /case NO BID 646.10 NO BID 659.00)
24 Natular XRT o
220 tablets/case /case 1090.61 NO BID NO BID NO BID
25 Coco Bear™ Mosquito Larvidice Oil
55 gallon drum /gil 46.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID
26 Ditrac® All-Weather BLOX
A 40 cases/640 Ibs /case NO BID 70.56 NO BID 60.44/
B 80 cases/1280 Ibs /case NO BID 70.56 NO BID 60.44]
27 Kaput Mini Blocks d
A 40 cases/640 Ibs /case NO BID 82.64 NO BID 86.92
B 80 cases/1280 Ibs /case NO BID 82.64 NO BID 86.92
28 Terad3 BLOX 5 d
A 40 cases/320 Ibs /case NO BID 143.68 NO BID 61.67]
B 80 cases / 640 Ibs /case NO BID 143.68 NO BID 61.67]
29 Fastrac BLOX .
A 40 cases/320 Ibs /case NO BID 99.24 NO BID 100.68]
B 80 cases/640 Ibs /case NO BID 99.24 NO BID 100.68|
30 Final Blox Rat and Mouse Bait d
A 40 cases/640 Ibs /case NO BID 94.27 NO BID 95.61
B 80 cases/1280 Ibs /case NO BID 94.27 NO BID 95.61
31 T1 Mouse Prebaited Stations 4 pk o o ol
Price per case (12 X 4 packs / case) Jcase NO BID 89.47 NO BID 90.79]
32 T1 Rat Disposable Bait Stations o
Price per case (8 stations/case) Jcase NO BID 57.16 NO BID 57.98]
33 Trapper Glue Boards . o
Price per case(48 Trapper Glue Boards) Jcase NO BID 50.93 NO BID 51.58]
34 Trapper TREX Rat Trap . . |
Price per case(12 snap traps/case) Jcase NO BID 53.47 NO BID 54.21]



mailto:customercare@clarke.com
mailto:John.west@veseris.com
mailto:aes@victorbids@azelis.com
mailto:kirsti.rodney@target-specialty.com
mailto:aes.vectororders@azelis.com
mailto:david.herter@target-specialty.com
mailto:aes.vectororders@azelis.com

	SB-2024-MC-155 Final

