
Bid Item: Unbranded Gasoline & Diesel Fuel

Bid Number SB-2024-CERTC-154

Effective Period: January 1, 2025 until December 31, 2025

Dept Personnel CERTC & SPECIAL DISTRICTS
Item #

1
Estimated

Annual 
Usage

Regular Unleaded Gasoline                                      
(Not transport loads)

24,000

Diesel Fuel (#2 Ultra Low Sulphur) (Taxed)                       
(Not transport loads)

69,000

Diesel Fuel (Off Road)-Dyed                           
(Not transport loads)

46,000

2 Deliverd Fuel for Generators Delivery Fee                     
Per location Margin on Bid

Delivery Fee                     
Per location Margin on Bid

Delivery Fee                     
Per location Margin on Bid

Delivery Fee                     
Per location Margin on Bid

Delivery Fee                     
Per location Margin on Bid

Regular Unleaded Gasoline                                      
(Conventional UN-87)

$150.00 $0.397443 $150.00 $0.511250 no bid no bid $150.00 $5.00 $225.00 $0.866441

Diesel Fuel (Ultra Low Sulphur)
$150.00 $0.397443 $150.00 $0.511250 no bid no bid $150.00 $5.00 $225.00 $0.866441

Diesel Fuel (Off Road)
$150.00 $0.198443 $150.00 $0.511250 $150.00 $0.150 $150.00 $5.00 $225.00 $0.866441

3 Picked up Fuel For Generators

Regular Unleaded Gasoline                       
(Conventional UN-87)

Diesel Fuel (Ultra Low Sulphur)

Diesel Fuel (Off Road)

Gaubert Oil LLC Lard Oil Company of 
Acadiana, LLC Miguez Fuel LLC Retif Oil & Fuel LLC Sun Coast Resources LLC

Primary contact- Kaylee Buss   985-
438-1918  

kaylee.buss@gaubertoil.com

Primary contact- Joey Leblanc   
337-558-7247   

jleblanc@lard365.com
337-365-3784 

orders@miguezfuel.com

Customer Service                         
504-349-9000                    

customerservice@retif.com

Order Entry Department                           
713-336-4545 

orderentry@suncoastresources.com

Grady Gaubert  
grady.gaubert@gaubertoil.com

Mike Ezell                           
mezell@lard365.com

George Aitken   
gaitken@miguezfuel.com

Jordan Retif  
salessupport@retif.com

Lisa Smith 
contractpricing@suncoastresources.com

10% bid preference 10% bid preference non-responsive

Megan Theriot                            
800-256-1250                      

orders@gaubertoil.com

Stacie Corbello                               
337-558-7247                            

scorbellow@lard365.com

George Aitken                                 
337-201-1910                        

gaitken@miguezfuel.com

Sales Support                               
504-349-9000                                 

salessuport@retif.com

Terri Bateman                                                          
713-429-6702                 

national@suncoastresources.com

$0.397443 $0.511250 no bid $0.475000 $0.416441

Margin on Bid Margin on Bid Margin on Bid Margin on Bid Margin on Bid

$0.198443 $0.511250 $0.150 $0.275000 $0.416441

$0.397443 $0.511250 no bid $0.475000 $0.416441

no bid $0.511250 no bid $0.50 $0.664410

Margin on Bid Margin on Bid Margin on Bid Margin on Bid Margin on Bid

no bid $0.511250 $0.150 $0.50 $0.664410

no bid $0.511250 no bid $0.50 $0.664410
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