
Bid Item: Gasoline & Diesel Fuel
Gaubert Oil LLC Lard Oil Company of 

Acadiana, LLC Miguez Fuel LLC Retif Oil & Fuel LLC

Bid Number SB-2024-PW-153
Grady Gaubert  

grady.gaubert@gaubertoil.com
Mike Ezell                           

mezell@lard365.com
George Aitken   

gaitken@miguezfuel.com
Jordan Retif  

salessupport@retif.com

Effective Period: January 1, 2025 until December 31, 2025

Primary contact- Kaylee Buss         
985-438-1918  

kaylee.buss@gaubertoil.com

Primary contact- Joey Leblanc   
337-558-7247   

jleblanc@lard365.com

337-365-3784 
orders@miguezfuel.com

Customer Service                         
504-349-9000                    

customerservice@retif.com

Dept Personnel Div of Engineering & Public Works

Megan Theriot                            
800-256-1250                      

orders@gaubertoil.com

Stacie Corbello                               
337-558-7247                            

scorbellow@lard365.com

George Aitken                                 
337-201-1910                        

gaitken@miguezfuel.com

Sales Support                               
504-349-9000                                 

salessuport@retif.com
Item # 10% bid preference 10% bid preference

1 Regular Unleaded Gasoline                          
(Conventional UN-87)

Estimated
Annual 
Usage Margin on Bid Margin on Bid Margin on Bid Margin on Bid

East Maintenance Facility
Swift Plant Road, Lake Charles 112,000 $0.340143 $0.42125 no bid $0.3250
West Maintenance Facility
Post Oak Road, Sulphur 38,000 $0.340143 $0.42125 no bid $0.3250
Other Calcasieu Parish Police Jury Sites                        
(Not Transport Loads) 24,000 $0.457343 $0.42125 no bid $0.3250

2 Diesel Fuel (#2 Ultra Low Sulphur) (Taxed)
Margin on Bid Margin on Bid Margin on Bid Margin on Bid

East Maintenance Facility
Swift Plant Road, Lake Charles 52,000 $0.340143 $0.41125 no bid $0.3250
West Maintenance Facility
Post Oak Road, Sulphur 29,000 $0.340143 $0.41125 no bid $0.3250
Other Calcasieu Parish Police Jury Sites                            
(Not Transport Loads) 69,000 $0.457343 $0.53125 no bid $0.3250

3 Diesel Fuel (Off Road)-Dyed
 Margin on Bid Margin on Bid Margin on Bid Margin on Bid

East Maintenance Facility
Swift Plant Road, Lake Charles 29,000 $0.145443 $0.52125 $0.150 $0.1250
West Maintenance Facility
Post Oak Road, Sulphur 23,000 $0.145443 $0.52125 $0.150 $0.1250
Other Calcasieu Parish Police Jury Sites
 (Not Transport Loads) 46,000 $0.258343 $0.52223 $0.150 $0.1250
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